
Hitler's Foreign Soldiers 

In 1977 the Swiss military historian Peter 

Gosztony published a book called Hitlers 
Fremde Heere (Hitler's Foreign Armies).* 
Most readers were surprised to learn that 
these foreign auxiliary units had never been 
requested by Hitler. 

It all started with Mussolini, who hem­
med and hawed in 1939 when Hitler con­
quered Poland in 28 days. When his ally 
invaded Russia in 1941, however, Musso­
lini, who had already stabbed France in the 
back in 1940, thought it opportune to join 
the German drive on Moscow, even 
though it was against the wishes of Hitler. II 
Duce ignored Der Fuhrer's objections and 
ordered three divisions to the Russian front 
"because Italy cannot stand aside, but must 
be actively engaged in this war." Gosztony 
writes: 

Mussolini tried hard to have his troops 
looked upon as equals of the Germans. In 
August 1941 he invited Hitler to inspect 
Italian divisions during a giant parade. 
The German general Keitel (later hanged 
at Nuremberg) accompanied Hitler and 
was shocked at what he saw. He wrote, 
"Especially the over-age officers make a 
poor impression, and make one wonder 
about the 'Kampfkraft' (fighting efficien­
cy) of their troops. How can such 'semi­
soldiers' stand up against Russian troops 
when they had been unable to stand up 
against the Greek soldiers ...." 

Later the Italian dictator ordered more 
divisions to leave for Russia, declaring pon­
tifically, "We must not stay behind smaller 
countries .... We owe these troops to our 
German all ies." Italy was notthe only Euro­
pean state to give military aid to the Ger­
man cause. Croatia, recently freed from the 
harsh rule of the Serbs, followed suit, then 
Romania, Slovakia, Hungary and Spain, 
with its famous Blue Division. All this with­
out a word from Hitler. These national units 
must be distinguished from the many thou­
sands of individual volunteers who served 
with the German armed forces. The nation­
al units had been ordered to fight alongside 
the Germans by their rulers who wanted to 
impress Hitler when he seemed to be a sure 
winner. As it turned out, he was not at all 
impressed. 

In regard to Romania, Hitler assured 
Marshal Antonescu that Germany did not 
want or expect his participation in the war. 
But the Romanian dictator declared heat­
edly that his country would join Germany 
the moment the invasion of Russia began. 
He had his way. At Stalingrad the poorly 

* Published by Econ Publishers, Dusseldorf, 
West Germany. 

led and poorly armed Romanian units were 
totally destroyed, and the Germans were 
unable to send their own troops in time to 
prevent a Russian breakthrough. Stalingrad 
was lost, and with it the German Sixth 
Army. 

As the war progressed and a German 
victory became more and more doubtful, 
the friendly cooperation and goodwill be­
tween Germans and their allies began to 
deteriorate. Foreign units complained they 
were being positioned at the most exposed 
points in the battle line, while Germans 
grew more convinced "foreigners" were 
no match for the Russians. In addition, most 
non-German troops were poorly equipped 
for the bitterly cold winter. Massive deser­
tions began. Whole regiments surrendered 
when Russian T-34 tanks lumbered into 
sight. Only the Spanish Blue Division held 
out admirably, as did French units at Berlin, 
where they fought against Russian armor to 
the end. As for the non-Germans who were 
integrated in German units, such as the 
Waffen SS, they fought like tigers and set 
new standards of military excellence. 

By 1944 the governments of the foreign 
units had contacted Moscow and offered to 
withdraw thei r troops or even to order them 
to fight against the Germans. Romania's 
Antonescu was overthrown and shot. Fin­
land left the war and concluded a separate 
armistice with Moscow, after having lost 
59,000 men. The Hungarians (136,000 
dead) switched sides and began to fight 
against the Germans in their midst. Croatia 
and Slovakia adopted the Hungarian ap­
proach, and in both countries a wild period 
of massacres by Communist-led forces be­
gan. Thousands of anti-Russian Croats and 
-Iovaks were murdered. 

And Mussolini? In January 1943, when 
events were already pointing toward a Ger­
man collapse, he asked Hitler in a letter to 
"allow the Italian troops a place of honor 
within the German frontlines, because 
other tasks like behind-the-front security 
wou Id be considered an affront to the Ital­
ian units in Russia." Hitler declined his 
fellow dictator's request and had the Ital ian 
troops retu rned to their homeland. He ex­
plained, "It makes no sense to comply with 
his [Mussolini's] request. We supply them 
with our best arms, but this fact alone does 
not improve thei r worth. I wi II not be fooled 
again." 

Propaganda Minister Dr. Josef Goebbels 
wrote in his diary, the Italians "cannot be 
used at the Eastern Front, and they cannot 
be used in North Africa. They cannot be 
used in the submarine warfare, not even for 
their own anti-aircraft at home. Der Fuhrer 
asks rightfully why the Italians are fighting 
at all." 

I n the postwar era it was not wise to 
mention the eager military conscripts and 
volunteers who tried to help Germany de­
stroy the Soviet Union. In 1945 soldiers 
returning from the Russian front were treat­
ed like pariahs. Powerful Communist par­
ties in the West demanded that historians 
refer to them only as "national fascist 
troops." After the war an almost total si­
lence about the foreign units prevailed, un­
til the Swiss military historian published his 
book and proved by facts and figures that 
Hitler had never wanted them and even 
had some of them sent home when they 
proved not to be battle-worthy. 

Misleading Pitch 

If the above solicitation is correct, then one of the best ways to meet blondes is to join this 
splashiest Zionist female organization. 
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Will We Share 
the Eagle's Fate? 

That eagle's fate and mine are one, 
Which, on the shaft that made him die, 
Espied a feather of his own, 
Wherewith he wont to soar so high. 

Edmund Waller 
"To a Lady Singing 
a Song of His Composing" 

The idea of the eagle struck by a feather 
from its own wing is proverbial. It appears 
not only in Aesop's Fables and the works of 
Aeschylus, Euripides and Dionysius of Hal­
icarnassus, but in the poetry of Byron and 
Thomas Moore. 

If one assumes that only Europeans had 
the genius to create modern technology, 
but that many other peoples, far more nu­
merous, have the talent to sustain it, then it 
is possible that future conflicts will deliver 
us toa fate like the proverbial eagle's. Much 
more likely, however, the "feather on the 
fatal dart," in Byron's words, will be our 
Western medicine and humanitarian im­
pulses, which could finally cause our dem­
ographic overwhelming. 

The Nordic "aesthetic prop," used in­
creasingly against Nordics, illustrates the 
same principle. When, in World War II 
movies, Jewish actors are cast as Nazis and 
Nordics are cast as Jews, our own virtues, 
physical and otherwise, are turned wicked­
ly against us. 

Last year, ABC ran a miniseries called 
The Mystic Warrior, about a fictitious Sioux 
Indian named Ahbleza who strove unsuc­
cessfully to unite all Indians in peaceful 
harmony. He was driven by visions of an 
approaching enemy, the white man, who 
was much stronger than all the red tribes 
combined. Watching the valiant Ahbleza 
struggling to convince his pig-headed fel­
lows of their impending fate, one was con­
tinually reminded of Instauration's lonely 
mission. Two aspects ofthe program which 
especially provoked sympathy for the In­
dian cause was its haunting music -- Euro­
pean music -- and its handsome actors -­
also European, in many cases. The Mystic 
Warrior was deeply moving at times -- but 
the emotions triggered were pu rely ersatz, 
in a racial sense. 

Yes, one could almost feel those Nordic 
feathers lining the arrow as it pierced one's 
bleeding heart! 

Outhouse Art 
An "artistic montage" largely consisting 

of a repainted and retouched three-hole 
outdoor toilet seat has been hailed in the 
New York Times as an authentic work of 
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the late Dutch immigrant, Willem de Koon­
ing, a prcx:Jucer of some of the ugliest junk 
in the mcx:Jern art scene. It will be interest­
ing to see how much the work will fetch 
when it is put on the auction block. Some 
de Kooning canvases have sold for as much 
as $2 million. One art expert compared the 
outhouse with a urinal sculpted by Marcel 
Duchamp in 1917, which is now consid­
ered a masterpiece by the Stone Age crea­
tures who officiate as curators of U.S. art 
museums. 

The Greens 
Are Coming 

At a most inopportune time, just when 
they are getting hell in West Germany for 
harboring Nazis in their ranks, the Greens 
are coming to the U.S. Many Americans, 
including some Instaurationists, have been 
receiving a pamphlet announcing the birth 
of a North American Greens Network (P.O. 
Box 392, New York, NY 10013). 

The letter contains slogans that are not 
exactly hostile to Instauration's line of 
thought: "Neither right nor left but ahead," 
"Unity through diversity," and suchlike. 
The "four pillars" of the Greens are promi­
nently underlined: (a) ecological action, (b) 
social responsibility, (c) base democracy 
(how base?), (d) nonviolence. A nationwide 
computer conference is set for sometime in 
the spring. 

The Greens, as we all know, have made 
quite a splash in West Germany, mainly as 
a reaction against the stodgy Bonn political 
machine. They touched a popular nerve 
with their concern about the environment 
and about preventing West Germany from 
becoming the battleground of a nuclear 
war between Russia and the U.S. It goes 
without saying that the Greens are all for 
nonalignment and neutrality. Who can 
blame them? Instaurationists might also be 
"neutralists" if they were West Germans, 
within reach of Russia's biggest -- and smal­
lest -- warheads. Many Germans (and many 
Americans) realize it would be much more 
convenient (and less messy) for Russia and 
the U.S. to slug it out on German territory 
than to nuke each other's country. 

Because die Grunen in the Vaterland 
have not been afraid to speak their minds, 
they have recently been denounced byvar­
ious Jewish organizations. The Greens' 
candidate for President of the Federal Re­
public is Luise Rinser, a maverick feminist 
who was jai led by Hitler, but whose studies 
of the origins ofJewish thought have led her 
to the conclusion that Jews are responsible 
for many of the evi Is of modern society. 
Moreover, Green parliamentary members 
have not participated in the servile, all-out 
support given Israel by the two major par­

ties. Recently, a Green member of the Euro­
pean Parliament, Brigitte Heinrich, was 
stopped at the Allenby Bridge and refused 
entry into Israel when she arrived at the 
border along with an official Middle East­
ern delegation. The Israelis claimed that 
Fraulein Heinrich was a "terrorist." 

Who Was First 
in America? 

The name of John Lloyd is now inscribed 
in the ever lengthening roster of those har­
dy souls who have been designated possi­
ble discoverers of the New World. In 1475, 
17 years before Columbus's first voyage, 
Lloyd, a Welsh seafarer, who also went 
under the name of John the Skillful, sailed a 
group of Greenlanders to the land around 
Hudson Bay. In 1477, when he returned to 
check on the settlers, he found everyone 
had frozen to death. 

Arthu r Davies, a British geographer, 
claims that Lloyd kept his voyage a secret 
because he was trading illegally with 
Greenland and because he didn't want any 
competition in his search for a Northwest 
passage to the Orient. 

John Lloyd may have beaten Columbus 
to the New World by 17 years, but accord­
ing to American scuba divers off the coast 
of Brazil, the Romans may have beaten 
Lloyd by 17 centuries. Two hundred Ro­
man amphorae (jars) of the type made in 
the second century B.C. have been found 
by two American undersea archaeologists, 
as well as some remains of the presumably 
Roman ship that carried them. However, 
right in the midst of the undersea research 
in Guanabara Bay, near Rio de Janeiro, the 
Brazilian Navy cancelled the divers' per­
mits. A few days later a Brazilian dredge 
arrived on the scene and covered the area 
with mud. Some superpatriotic Brazilians 
apparently don't want anyone, especially 
two gringos, to challenge the universally 
accepted claim that Brazil was discovered 
in 1500 by Portuguese navigator Pedro Al­
vares Cabral. 

Budgetary Fangs 
The budget is not real; it's merely sym­

bolic. If it were real, the government would 
be officially bankrupt. 

As a symbol, the budget informs us that 
things are not what they used to be, thatthe 
Protestant Ethic is dead in these parts. The 
country and we the countrymen no longer 
pay our way, which is paid not by work and 
profit but by debt and printing presses. 

The budget tells us that from a land of 
producers we have turned into a land of 
plungers. Half of the population is now 
laboring to provide handouts for the other 
half. Soon the ratio may be 25% doers, 
75% undoers. Soon most of us will be 
spending most of our time maintaining and 



repairing manufactured goods from 
abroad, as the USA becomes the United 
Services of America. 

Some day the symbol ism of the budget 
will become harsh reality, as the fuzzy and 
blurred psychological view of the economy 
fades and the real picture comes into focus. 
Then we better hold on to our hats. Inflation 
will bounce into the double-digit bracket. 
The government will start singing the old 

- song about price controls, socking it to the 
rich and taxing everybody and everything 
in sight. As the black market gets blacker, 
the ink and the politicians will get redder. It 
will take a shopping cart full of paper mon­
ey to fill our shopping carts with cardboard­
tasting food. Welfarists will have more dol­
lars than ever, but wi II never get less for 
them. 

Close to $200 billion deficits in a time of 
- -economic recovery -- in a boom, yet! What 

will happen at the next downturn in the 
economic cycle? What will happen when 
Congress has to double and triple spending 
to stop food riots and inner-city looting? A 
yearly $300, $400 or $500 billion deficit 
will have difficulty remaining symbolic. 
Somebody, somewhere, will start count­
ing. Somebody, somewhere, will start us­
i ng a Iittle arithmetic. 

One day, my friends, one day the piper 
will have to be paid. But with chaos, not 
with dollars. Hidden inside them, some 
symbols have long and poisonous fangs. 

A Different Kind 
of Immigrant 

The Exposition of Nordic Culture and Art 
held at New York's Lincoln Center in Sep­
tember 1982, featured Vigdfs Finnboga­
d6ttir, president of Iceland, as the keynote 
speaker. She took as her theme the words of 
Emma Lazarus and their inapplicability to 
the Scandinavian immigrants who also 
sailed past "The New Colossus." 

The historical fact is that most of the 
Scandinavians who came here were not 
"huddled masses" or "wretched refuse." 
They were sturdy, skilled people who 
had sufficient ambition to want to better 
themselves, and who had saved the 
wherewithal to do it. They were the get­
up-and-go people who -- got up and 
went! 

And this was just as true of the Viking 
Age as it was of the 19th century. The 
Vikings came thrusting out of their home­
lands not because they were refugees 
from poverty and oppression, but be­
cause they had tasted the good things of 
life in Scandinavia -- and wanted an even 
better place in the sun. And what did they 
have to "declare"? Genius, yes, in some 
things -- in their artwork, for instance, in 
their literature as well. But above all, raw 
energy. 

And those are the very things that the 

new Vikings of the 19th century immigra­
tions had to declare in their cultural bag­
gage: raw energy; a capacity for hard, 
skilled work -- no, more than that, a real 
desire for hard, skilled work; a love of 
good craftsmanship, whether in words or 
in wood; and above all, a reverence for 
learning. They were farmers, perhaps, 
who enjoyed cultivating their culture as 
much as tilling their fields. 

Justthink of the .. . enormous cultural 
contribution that the Scandinavian na­
tions have made to the world -- espe­
cially when you consider that all the Nor­
dic [i.e., Scandinavian) populations put 
together only add upto about 20 million. 

The complete address appears in the 
Spring 1984 edition of Scandinavian Re­
view. 

President of Iceland 

Subtract 2 
from the 6 x 10 6 

Anyone who knows anything about big­
time capitalists knows that they are the last 
ones to rock the pol itical boat. Though 
American corporation chiefs generally pre­
fer the Republican Party, they have also 
contributed heavily to Democratic candi­
dates. But who can name one CEO who has 
angeled the Populist or other Majority-ori­
ented third parties? 

Since the birth of the Third Reich it has 
been common practice for leftwing and 
Marxist historians to attribute the rise of 
Hitler to the financial subsidies of German 
industrial magnates. To add more myth to 
this mythology, David Abraham, a Prince­
ton historian, recently wrote The Col/apse 
of the Weimar Republic. The book contains 
dozens of doctored quotes and at least 60 

misleading footnotes -- so much fabrication 
and distortion that even a few members of 
the cowardly, fact-shy American Historical 
Association summoned up the courage to 
denounce Abraham and his work. 

One typical Abraham ploy is revealed in 
his dedication, which reads as follows: 
"For my parents, who at Auschwitz and 
elsewhere, suffered the worst conse­
quences of what I can only write about." 
These heart-tugging words are somewhat 
obfuscating since Abraham's father and 
mother are both very much alive. 

No Pick Up, 
No Delivery 

Federal Express has decided to stop pick- ­
ing up and delivering to the Bedford Stuy­
vesant wasteland of Brooklyn. Who can 
blame it? Its drivers and couriers have been 
assaulted, wounded, robbed and threat­
ened with death. But prodded by govern­
ment agencies, which in turn had been 
prodded by Leonard H. Weiss, one of the 
few remaining businessmen in the Brook­
lyn battlefield, Federal Express may have to 
continue its deliveries or lose government 
business or, worse, be brought to the dock 
for racial discrimination. 

Which raises an interesting legal point. 
Can men and women be charged with a 
crime for refusing to enter a life-threatening 
combat zone like Bedford Stuyvesant or 
South Chicago? If so, the Postal Service, in 
spite of its high wages, United Parcel and 
other package and del ivery services are go­
ing to have difficulty finding drivers. And 
the stock of companies like Federal Express 
is going to fall like a ton of bricks. 

Persecution Plus 
Early last November a dozen members of 

the International Committee Against Ra­
cism (what a misnomer!) stormed the office 
of Dean Bruno Boley of Northwestern Uni­
versity and presented him with an ultima­
tum: "Fire Arthur Butz." A tenured profes­
sor of electrical engineering, Butz is the 
gutsy author of what may turn out to be one 
of the most banned books of all time, The 
Hoax of the Twentieth Century. 

Boley said he would only speak to three 
of them. When the others had shuffled off, 
the remnant persisted in asking him why he 
hadn't fired Butz. When he replied that he 
had no intention of doing so, the trio staged 
a sitdown, warning that they would not 
leave until Boley caved in to their de­
mands. Boley called the campus police, 
who arrested the three. They were quickly 
released under a $50 bond. 
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Model Democrats 
The controversies surrounding john A. 

Zaccaro are never-ending: shady associ­
ates, chiseling on taxes, helping his wife 
bend the campaign financing rules, illegal­
ly borrowing funds from the estate of an 
aged nursing home resident, ad nauseam. 
Zaccaro's dirtiest (known) deeds came ear­
ly in 1983, when he falsified various docu­
ments to make his net worth look like $21.6 
million instead of $4 million, in order to 
obtain financing. Through his crooked 
dealings, Zaccaro stood to gain $333,000 
in brokerage commissions plus an 8% in­
terest in some apartments worth $12 mil­
lion. Luckily, some routine auditing last 
spring of credit union loans put the feds on 
Zaccaro's trail, and the end result was his 
guilty plea to a wrist-slap misdemeanor 
fraud charge. 

Calling her husband a "decent, honor­
able man," Geraldine Ferraro said he had 
"freely [sic] admitted his mistake" and suf­
fered because of her candidacy (rather than 
because of the audit). Zaccaro pointed out 
that he had "received no benefit" from the 
scam. Quite right because he was 
caught! But he stood to gain at least a mil­
lion. 

If Zaccaro had been a Republican or an 
ordinary joe, he would have gone to jail. In 
Democratic Zoo City, a Democratic judge 
sentenced him to 150 hours of "commun­
ity service." 

Mr. Druse 
Speaks Out 

Some interesting quotes came out of the 
Playboy interview (July 1984) with ~alid 
Jumblatt, leader of Lebanon's Druse, who 
are described as "the most homogeneous 
group in a country of vividly contrasting 
nationalities, sects and political ideology." 
Jumblatt, who has a strikingly attractive 
blonde Jordanian wife, predicted: 

America will be invaded by the Hispan­
ics, Mexicans and others. I think that you 
can't build a fence. The whole Western 
world will be invaded by the poor of the 
world, from the south, before they die of 
hunger. 

Describing the Druse for the benefit of 
the Playboy interlocutor, Jumblatt ex­
plained, "Well, it's an Islamic sect, an off­
shoot of Islam. It goes back to the tenth 
century. Although its roots are in Islam, we 
were greatly influenced by Greek philoso­
phy, Platonic philosophy .... Among the 
Druse Plato and Socrates are venerated." 

As for the American intervention in the 
Lebanese war, 
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[The New Jersey} shelling destroyed en­
tire villages. But that doesn't mean that I 
have any profound hatred or dislike to­
ward Americans or Westerners .... 
They're not responsible. The Gis who 
went to Beirut are not responsible for 
Reagan's policies. He decided to send 
them to be killed .... I didn't think of 
them Ithe Marines] as enemies. But they 
were ordered to fire on me, so I had to 
answer back. Poor chaps, I don't think 
they knew what they were doing in Leba­
non .... 

The fault, Jumblatt said, lay elsewhere. 

[Henry Kissinger is] partly, or greatly, re­
sponsible for our problems.... He 
thought it was possible to have separate 
deals between Israel and the Arab states 
.... The policy of Kissinger and Nixon 
Iwas]: one, separate Egypt from the Arab 
world; two: deal with the Palestinians in 
Lebanon, strike at the Palestinians there; 
weaken them. 

And so it was done. 

Spare That 
File Cabinet 

Those who wou Id save Western man 
from drowning beneath an imposed alien 
tide should be stockpiling rare books and 
manuscripts more than guns. The new 
technology of information storage could 
make our racial conservators' task easier-­
unless the past masters of book-burning 
take to erasing computer tapes. 

The information battle is more than an 
academic game. It is ultimately a fight for 
survival. An article in The Spotlight by 
Sasha Rakoczy (Sept. 10, 1984) recounted 
the tactical use of arson by Israeli secret 
agents on a global basis. The best-known 
incidents occurred in Cairo and Alexan­
dria, Egypt, in 1954, when Mossad opera­
tives torched the U.S. Information Agency 
libraries and tried to pin the blame on 
"Arab terrorists" (the "Lavon Affair"). But, 
Rakoczy warns, Egypt is "not the only 
cou ntry where Israel i terror operatives 
were ordered to burn books, set fire to files 
and other research documents, and raze 
the cultural resources of any institution that 
generated critical or revisionist scholarship 
about the Middle East." 

During the late 1970s, academic re­
search centers in Nantes, France; Hilver­
sum, Netherlands; and Milan, Italy, were 
destroyed by fi res that investigators 
found to have been deliberately set. 

At first, this terrorism was blamed on 
"right-wing extremists" who had been 
involved in public disputes with left-radi­
cal student groups. Eventually, however, 

the acts of arson were traced to David 
Zameret, identified as the son of an early 
Israeli spy master, now himself an agent 
of the Mossad's Covert Action Detach­
ment. 

With the rank of colonel, Zameret sub­
sequently served in Washington as the 
head of a military purchasing and coord­
inating mission, an assignment that gave 
this spy the temporary rank of deputy 
ambassador. 

Last summer's arson attack on the anti­
Zionist Institute for Historical Review in 
Torrance, Cal ifornia, caused Rakoczy to re­
flect that Jerusalem nearly always places 
one of its leading terror-oriented Mossad 
agents into the number-two embassy posi­
tion in Washington. Zameret, Ephraim Ev­
ron and Zvi Rafiah are several of the top 
Mossad terrorists who have served their 
country and disserved America as deputy 
ambassadors to the United States. 

The Pontiff's Threat 
High-school history teaches us that the 

papacy gave up or was stripped of the last 
of its temporal power in the 19th century. 
Not so. Any reader of The Year ofArmaged­
don by Gordon Thomas and Max Morgan­
Wits (Grenada, London, 1984) cannot help 
but come away with the opinion that the 
Vatican is the center of a worldwide politi­
cal network. It may be promoting peace, 
but it is promoting it more as a political than 
a religious undertaking. The Pope may be 
cracking down on priests running for or 
holding office, but he himself in some of his 
activities seems to be following more in the 
footsteps of the Renaissance warrior pon­
tiff, Julius II, than in those of the recently 
deceased "gentle" John XXIII. 

The two authors tell us that when the 
Russians were mobilizing and about to 
march into Poland to put down Sol idarity 
once and for all, john Paull! is reported to 
have written the Kremlin that if the Soviet 
military should interfere in Poland, he 
would resign his triple crown, return to his 
native land and personally lead the Polish 
armed resistance. 

The threat worked. The Russian armies 
stayed put. But the Soviets never forgave 
the Pope for this power play and their dis­
like of the papacy grew to such proportions 
that the KGB ordered its Bulgarian hitmen 
into action. Mehmet Ali Agca, the profes­
sional Turkish assassin, almost pulled it off, 
his bullets just missing the Pope's vital or­
gans. Agca, by the way, had just ended a 
torrid homosexual affair with a fellow Turk 
when he set out on his mission. 

The Year ofArmageddon leaves the read­
er with some disturbing thoughts about the 
aftermath of the attempted assassination. 
The CIA, at the behest of higher-ups in the 
Reagan administration, has been urging the 
Italians to go easy in their investigation of 



the Bulgarians, who Agca claims used .him 
as a hired gun. The CIA argued that, smc~ 
the trail was bound to lead to Moscow, It 
would only embarrass the Politburo and 
make it more difficult to come to a Soviet­
American arms agreement and restore de­
tente. Such CIA machinations, needless to 
say, have been most displeasing to the 
Pope, who forgave Agca after a personal 
visit to his jail cell, but who Will never 
forgive Agca's paymasters, who happen to 
be the past and present oppressors of his 
native land. 

They Never 
Apologize 

The newly published papers of the late 
Colonel Truman Smith have taught us that 
Charles lindbergh's "friendliness" toward 
Nazi Germany was largely a ploy which 
allowed him access to some of their mili­
tary secrets. Though lindbergh admired 
certain facets of the National Socialist sys­
tem he did so as an American citizen with 
his ~ation's interest always first in mind. In 
light of how the media have long smeared 
lindbergh for the basic civility w~ich ,he 
showed the Nazis, one shudders to Imagme 
the reaction had he gone to Germany in the 
late 1920s and exorted the people to join 
the Brownshirts! 

Yet Helen Foster Snow, with and without 
her husband Edgar Snow, wrote books 
which praised Chinese communism 
books which Book World assures us caused 
"educated Chinese [to commit] their lives 
to the Communists"; and, having exerted 
such an influence, she is still roundly 
praised by the weekly literary supplement 
of the Washington Post. 

Snow's recently published memoir, My 
China Years (Morrow), complains bitterly 
of the problems she had selling her writings 
for a brief spell during the McCarthy era. 
Back in the 1930s Helen and Edgar had 
started a salon for revolutionaries in Pe­
king. Their pro-Maoist books subsequently 
achieved translation into many languages, 
including Chinese, where they probably 
had the greatest influence. Rece~tlYI Hel~n 
was nominated for the Nobel Prize for Lit­
erature. Book World's jay Mathews con­
cluded his puff piece by calling her "so 
early, so ahead of her time." 

The same reviewer also gushed over 
Anna louise Strong, the late "belle of the 
progressive literature circuit," w~ose hag­
iography, Right in Her Soul, written by a 
grandnephew and his wife, has been pub­
lished by Random House. The authors, we 
are told, 

collected 7,600 pages of government re­
ports, mostly from the FBI. The agency 
kept a lively interest in this descendan~of 
some of the oldest families in Amerrca 
who often let Communist Party officials 
review her stories and was married dur­

ing the '30s to the ed itor of a Soviet news­
paper. If they had read her private letters, 
perhaps the newest and most telling 
sources in this book, they would have 
seen how little they had to fear. 

Strong, it seems, was "supremely intelli­
gent," "wonderfully open-minded," ~et 
"innocent," with a "church-bred SOCial 
conscience." But in a revealing passage, 
Mathews writes, "The disappearance of 
many of her friends in the Chinese Cultural 
Revolution eroded her confidence [in the 
Reds] ... even while her famous Letters 
from China extolled communes and educa­
tional reforms." Still, no irony was intend­
ed when Mathews concluded, "she helped 
many of the rest of us see things more clear­
Iy./I 

That Willie 
If Budweiser decides to revise its "Great 

Black Kings" poster series, it should drop 
the white Hannibal and add America's 
contribution to the genre, Willie Brown. 
When he isn't blaming reactionary honkies 
for keeping black people poor, the Speaker 
of the California State Assembly is stuffing 
his closet with $1,500 hand-stitched Bri­
ono suits, $250 red lizard boots, $50 Pan­
caldi ties, $110 Schlogon shorts and filling 
his garage with a Mercedes, a Porsche Ca.r­
rera and a jaguar. "If you can't wear It, 
drive it or make love to it," says Willie. "I 
don't want it." That sounds very much like 
an old Earl Butz joke, but it's not Brown, 
but a California newspaper publisher, Er­
nest V. Joiner of Sebastapol, who's in trou­
ble for havi ng written apropos of the Speak­
er, that "use of the term 'nigger' [is justi­
fied1 in special cases." 

Willie Brown 

Rock lovers can see Willie in a recent 
video by Jefferson Starship, jiving on the 
dance floor. One scene shows a "u.s. ad­
viser" holding Latin American soldiers on 
chain leashes. 

Last summer, California voters passed 
Proposition 24, an initiative specifically de­

signed to strip Brown of most of his perks 
and prerogatives by requiring a two-thirds 
majority vote for most procedural deci­
sions in the California legislature and re­
moving Brown's power to appoint commit­
tee chairmen and members. It also reduced 
by 30% the legislature's $130 million bud­
get, which almost doubled in the last four 
years. 

So far Brown has simply defied the will of 
the California electorate and gone about 
his old business at the old stand in the 
manner of black African dictators. Not only 
are the California legislators too wimpish to 
implementthe law, they haven't even taken 
Brown to court. All the anti-Brown faction 
is doing is drafting a new proposition to put 
before the voters in 1986 in the hope that 
this one, should it be approved, can bring 
Brown to heel. 

If on the off chance, Brown is finally
tam~d and retired from a body in which he 
is the least capable of all men to serve, he 
may return to his old law practice in the 
Haight-Ashbury district, where he made his 
first claim to fame defending pimps and 
prostitutes. Meanwhile, after having re­
cently acqu ired a ticket for driving 95 miles 
an hour while reading a newspaper, Brown 
tools nonchalantly around Sacramento in 
his 12-cylinder black Jag. 

Will the Real McCoy 
Please Stand Up? 

A recent four-color flyer hustling sub­
scriptions to Cobblestone, a histo.ry m~ga­
zine for kids, contains the follOWing piece 
of biographical fantasy: 

Meet remarkable people -- such as 
lithe real McCoy," a black railroad en­
gineer whose clever invention in the 19th 
century made his name synonymous 
with product quality and integrity .... 

Since it wou Id cost $8.50, the price of the 
subscription, to find out, we will probably 
never learn about McCoy's "clever inven­
tion." But, ever skeptical about Negro in­
ventors, we found an entirely differ~nt 
McCoy in the Random House College DIC­
tionary (1980): 

McCoy, n" slang. The genuinethingor 
person as promised, stated, or implied 
(usually preceded by "the" or "~he 
real"): "Those other paintings are copies, 
but this one is the McCoy." Said to refer 
to a [white] U.S. pugilist, Kid McCoy, 
distinguishing him from an obscure or 
inferior boxer of the same name. 

The Encyclopaedia Britannica (Vol. ,3, 
949) has its own special McCoy, a white 
sea captain named William McC~y who 
smuggled liquor into the U.S. dUrl~g t~e 
bootlegging era and "who took pride In 

having his cargo known as 'the real 
McCoy.' " 
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Choll~ CBilderbergel' 

(Continued from front cover) 

Speaking of aid to Israel, Clem Bottomley, of the perma­
nent staff at the Bypassing the Executive and the legislative 
Action Committee On Behalf of Israeli Budgetary Needs, 
says, "Not to worry. If Congress or Reagan or Shultz start 
dragging their feet, we'll go over their heads to the Ameri­
can people. Plus putting the squeeze on all Congressmen 
and Senators, who talk big in public, but wag their little 
tails in private. We can deliver 82% of the Senate and 87% 
of the House of Representatives on any important Israel 
vote. And Reagan and Shultz know it. And know we know 
it. They only talk to hear the sound of their own voices." 

Ecstatic: Americans everywhere about the success of the 
public television series Heritage: Civilization and the Jews. 
Officials at WNET, the New York station where the show 
was produced, have announced that the first national run 
of the nine-part series on the history of Jews in the develop­
ment of Western civilization was seen by 50 million peo­
pie. Interest was particularly strong in the Bible Belt and the 
western states. There has been a great deal of spinoff. An 
accompanying book by Abba Eban, the Israeli diplomat 
who served as host and chief consultant for the series, is a 
best-seller. Viewer's guides have been snapped up in large 
numbers to assist discussions in schools throughout the 
country. More than 150 colleges have used Heritage as a 
cou rse, and more than 500 are expected to do so next fall 
when the series is rebroadcast. 
"We couldn't be happier," says the Reverend Jim Bob 
Simpson, assistant to Jerry lumpkin, the founder of Fair 
Play in Passion Plays. "See, the way it works is in layers. 
First, we had to see that the state of Israel received all-out 
support so that the prophecy of the angel Gabriel and Billy 
Sunday and Dr. Graham would be realized -- that the Jews 
would return to their homeland. Next came the revelations 
of the Holocaust, which show that Satan could beat on the 
Jews all he wanted to, but they wou Id get away in large 
numbers and stronger than ever. Now we're moving into 
the phase in which all the peoples of the earth, but espe­
cially those in my own state of Arkansas and the rest of 
Dixie and all Americans wherever they are, come to under­
stand that without the Jews there WOLI Id be no America as 
we know it because America is the culmination of all 
Western civilization, and Western civilization could not 
have moved out of the caveman phase had it not been for 
the Jews. In their God-mandated position as the Chosen of 
this world, the Jews have shown us since antiquity how to 
attain civilization. When we have followed them we have 
been blessed, with everything from the Holy Grail to tele­
vision. When we have resisted them, we have gotten into 
terrible hot water -- Black Plagues, wars, pestilence, the 
Four Horsemen unleashed, Hitler and Idi Amin, and just 

plain savagery in general. This series explains how it all 
works, and should be seen by every American at least 
twice a year. Accompanied by discussion or college 
courses." The same sentiments are echoed by Gervase 
Bracklay, now T oynbee Professor of Civi I ization and Chal­
lenge at Yale. Professor Bracklay, the authorof43 books on ­
the perils, past and present, facing civilization, began his 
career at Cambridge, and was much influenced by Ber­
trand Russell, "Freddie" Ayers and Gerald Heard. In his 
youth he found time to be linked romantically with Iris 
Tree, Nancy Cunard and E.M. Forster. He served as Field 
Marshal Montgomery's personal adviser on civilization 
during World War II, and later filled the same role on an 
informal basis for many British and American groups. "The 
Reverend Jim Bob puts it crudely," he says, "but not inac­
curately. Without the Jews, Western civilization would not 
have happened -- after all, they supplied the bedrock for 
the religion which was its foundation -- and could not have 
been maintained. I very much hope that the Heritage series 
will assist in creating permanent realization of this fact, not 
only in this generation of young people, but in all genera­
tions to come. I also hope that the next step in world 
education will be a series dealing with the future as bril-
Iiantly as Heritage dealt with the past. Perhaps simply 
called Hope, it could show us a future in which Jewish 
values and ethical responsibility triumph at last over non­
Jewish indifference and moral lethargy in the West. Under 
Jewish leadership -- finally overt and 'out of the closet' -­
we might be able to surmount those challenges which 
every civilization to date has failed." 

In a recent poll taken by the Friends of Incoming Hispanics 
Ad Hoc Pro Tem and De Jure Committee of 1,562 high­
school students in the Miami area, only 27% were aware 
that Cuba is not part of the United States. 34% do not speak 
English and 11 % do not speak Spanish. The rest -- 55% -­
are bilingual. 8% thought Fidel Castro was governor of 
Florida, and 32% did not know that Florida was part of the 
USA. Only 42% could identify Ronald Reagan as president 
of the country. 73% thought Texas was part of Mexico. 
87% did not realize that unlimited immigration is theoreti­
cally illegal. 2% had heard of the Mayflower and Plymouth 
Rock. 0% had heard ofJamestown. Only 4% could identify 
the opposing sides in the Civil War. 92% had heard of the 
Alamo, but only 19% could identify the defenders correct­
ly. 

To the Point: A bulletin from the John Garfield/ Arthur 
Rubenstein/Clifford Odets/lillian Hellman Chapter (Mid­
Manhattan, East Side) of the Find Josef Mengele for Elie 
Wiesel and Anne Frank National Pledge, in which the 
following suggestion is made: "When caught, Mengele 
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should be taken to Jerusalem in irons, and tried and con­
victed, and then executed in front of the Wailing Wall. All 
top officials of the U.S. State Department and Pentagon, 
the organization which shielded him for so many years, 
should be forced to attend the execution, as should Presi­
dent Reagan, Elizabeth II and other heads of state. After 
Mengele is pronounced dead, they all should abase them­
selves before the Wailing Wall in appropriate fashion and 
beg forgiveness for having allowed the monster to elude 
justice for so long." 

Literary Find of the Decade: The Civil War diaries of Wil­
liam Coffin Peabody, the Boston aristocrat who organized 
the Crispus Attucks Regiment, composed entirely of run­
away slaves, and led them to victory as a top fighting unit in 
General Sherman's Army. Colonel Peabody, enlightened 
and amazingly anticipatory of attitudes scores of years in 
the future, had to keep many of his reflections confined to 
these private memoirs. The diaries lay for over a century in 
the attic of a distant cousin, Imogene Lowell, in Wellfleet, 
Massachusetts. They were discovered a few months ago by 
Cabot Portnoy, Senior Fellow for Trans-African Studies at 
Harvard. Dr. Portnoy is currently readying them for publi­
cation. We are privi leged to be able to offer some extracts: 

"May 13, 1864, near Dalton, Georgia: Heavy fighting 
yesterday, my men distinguished themselves as always. 
Thoughts of home - order, the piety of our leading men, 
which we so take for granted, Thoreau, Emerson - and 
then compare with the pathetic barbarism of the whites we 
see here. And they in marked contrast to the splendid­
looking, and remarkably intelligent slaves who throng to 
us .... Yesterday, a chess game and a discussion on free­
dom - Platonic conception of - with an ex-slave named 
Scipio. Contrast with Captain Sumner, a wretched speci­
men from the 14th, who came to me complaining that his 
men could not bunk down in the former quarters of some 
slaves on a plantation near here because of 'the nigger 
stench.' Went to the quarters with him and found his men 
stinking so formidably that no other odor could be de­
tected. For my own enlightenment, went into slave quar­
ters elsewhere which were pristine - as they were, no 
whites having billeted there - and inhaled deeply to find 
only the pleasing muskiness of Negroes in a close space for 
many years. Far less offensive than a white smell under 
comparable circumstances. In fact, not offensive at all, but 
invigorating and attractive. 

"May 26, 1864, Dallas, Georgia: Scipio has now joined 
the Regiment and he and Mrs. Scipio - Letitia - came to 
tea yesterday afternoon. Their perfect and instinctive 
breed i ng in contrastto the crud ity of Southern wh ites. They 
made no mistakes with teacups, utensils and little cakes, 
and kept up a steady flow of conversation which would 
have passed with high colors in Louisberg Square, or even 
Concord .... Compare with a silly woman named Hor­
tense Pelham who came to see me to assert that two of my 
men stole some chickens from her and cooked and ate 
them in fu II view of her house, and subsequently raped her 
mother. A preposterous story, which I disproved by inter­
rogati ng the men in front of her. She insu Ited them by 

calling them liars, and I had her escorted back through our 
lines. There is no limitto the mendacity of Southerners.... 
A walk with Mrs. Scipio - Letitia - along the banks of a 
pretty stream near here. I complimented her on her frock, 
and she told me she had copied it from one of her mistress's 
Paris importations. I confess that I am amazed at the re­
markable skills of these ex-slaves. And their charm. And 
beauty - Letitia has the form of a goddess and as noble 
and beautiful a face as any I have seen in any part of New 
England. 
"July 9, 1864, before Atlanta: A long walk with Scipio after 
our daily chess game. He is concerned about his future, 
and I told him I would sponsor him for Harvard College. 
However, his spelling and writing are a bit rusty, and I 
suggested that he return to the plantation where he former­
ly lived - many miles north of here - in order to find the 
peace and quiet he needs to brush up on his studies. After 
this cruel war is ended, I shall send for him, and he can 
come to Boston. He was not altogether enthusiastic about 
this suggestion, but changed his mind when I gave him a 
horse and arms and a letter authorizing him to make the 
necessary requisitions from civilians along the way and at 
the plantation for his personal needs and comfort .... 
Later, a lovely ride with Letitia, during the course of which I 
outlined Scipio's plans for his future, and my regrets that 
she could not accompany him back to the plantation be­
cause of the dangers in this wartorn area, but would remain 
with the regiment under my protection. She nodded her 
head gravely and then gave me a radiant smile. I shall buy 
her a new riding habit when we take Atlanta .... In the 
evening, a talk to the men on the debt owed them by their 
former owners, and ways and means of collecting it in full. 
Read Plutarch's Amatorius before retiring, and derived 
much edification from it. Also wrote a letter to Mr. and Mrs. 
Gibbs, the parents of Private Gibbs, who was discovered in 
flagrante delicto with General Sherman's horse last week 
and sentenced to three months confinement. I explained to 
them that the sentence was based on the color of his skin 
and not on the evidence; and that I am lodging an appeal 
with the reviewing court and the senior adjutant." 

Eagle 

Let eagles soar where eagles dare, 
Beyond the smoke-filled plain, 

Where mortals fill their stagnant air 
With talk of wealth and fame. 

Allow that single soaring beast 
To rise on currents proud, 

Above the warm and earthly feast 
So valued by the crowd. 

Let winter close around his home 
In mountains lost from sight, 

Where from his crag -- and quite alone-­
He rules the Arctic night. 

113 
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I've been sounding off on the dispiriting state of Ameri­
can television for several months now. Judging from the 
mail, at least a few Instaurationists have been reading the 
Satcom Sam column, perhaps more than a few, if we're to 
believe that old adage that only one out of a hundred 
subscribers ever writes a letter to a magazine. Since my 
correspondents have made some interesting points about 
America's electromagentic obsession, I am going to let 
them take over my column this month, while I take an 
undeserved break. 

o I generally do not watch much TV -- not more than 10 
hours per week -- but I must confess to being a fan of Star 
Trek, currently being rerun each afternoon on a local sta­
tion. It is the only "integrated" program I watch. I probably 
react to Star Trek the same way all too many Majority 
members react to everyday life -- I blink away the non­
whites. 

Blasphemy of blasphemies, Mr. Spock is my favorite Star 
Trek character. In many ways he comes close to acting like 
a Nordic -- cool, self-composed, thoughtful and logical. An 
outer-space Marlboro 
Man with pointed ears. 
Star Trek seems to con­
centrate on contrasting 
human emotionalism 
with Vulcan unemotion­
alism, though I'm not sure 
the contest can't be more 
properly described as 
mudmanism vs. Nordi­
cism. To see Mr. Spock 
neck-deep in emotional 
humans is to see Nordic 
man neck-deep in the 
dark-white and colored 
races. 

Race-mixing is a common Star Trek theme, a number of 
the programs being nothing but miscegenation messages 
of the utmost transparency. Spock, himself a mixed breed, 
is often a victim of the disruptive interior stresses produced 
by hybridism, since he is constantly tormented by his 
Vulcan devil warring against his human devil. It is curious 
that the Star Trek producers and writers have capitalized 
on a theme which accentuates the problems caused by 
gene mixing. Possibly they didn't think their viewers were 
intelligent enough to draw the appropriate parallels be­
tween alien and human mixes and black and white mixes. 
In Spock's case, his Vulcan half dominates his human half, 
which to me is the same as a Swedish Italian striving to be 
Swedish -- an almost unthinkable turn of events in this late, 
anti-Nordic 20th century. 

Of course, I realize that the real Spock is a Jewish actor 
named Leonard Nimoy, just as I know that Captain Kirk is 
the Jewish actor William Shatner. But when it comes to 
actors, it's not what they are, but how they play their roles. 
Spock, no matter what his chromosomes, plays a man of 
Nordic temperament, just as Shatner with his peroxided 
hair plays a naval officer with a Nordic sense of order and 
command. 
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Two other TV productions attracted my attention re­
cently. The first was a rerun of a mid-70s flick, The Norse­
man, starring Lee Majors. Besides the horned helmets, the 
prime inaccuracy I noticed was the presence of a black 
Viking -- woolly hair, thick lips, prognathous jaw, receding 
chin, flat nose, burnt-toast eyes and all the rest. I may be 
wrong, but I suspect there were about as many Negroes on 
longships as there will be on starships. Can you imagine 
Homo Erectus Rhodesianensis (I use the name advisedly) 
ever taking "one giant leap for mankind" in any direction 
other than backwards? 

D Am I the only one who is utterly repulsed by those inane 
little TV spiels they run during all the football games urging 
young people to "join the Armed Forces"? Is this what 
Western civilization has come to -- military service "mark­
eted" by ad agency sharpies along with their beer, dental 
glue and laundry detergent accounts? "Demographic re­
search" has told them that the age group they're after 
watches Sunday afternoon football, and on such research 
rests the success of the defense of our Western civilization! 
Is this the way Alexander the Great recruited his armies? 
Did Hermann the Cherusker summon up the manpower to 
defy the Roman legions with a 60-second commercial 
promising an education in "electronics and computers"? 
Surely, whatever the inequities of the draft, it had more 
dignity than this. 

D Recently Leroi Jones/lmamu Amiri Baraka, the high­
octane Negro racist with the Jewish ex-wife, appeared on 
PBS's Late Night America . Dennis Wholey, the wimpy, 
ex-alcoholic host, slobbered all over him, serving up the 
usual combination of creampuff questions and worshipful 
respect, while Jones/Baraka worked an overworked vein in 
an overworked mine. All very predictable to an Instaura­
tionist. Leroi's peak "moment of rage" (rage being, after 
all, what pays his rent) came in response to some hapless 



white who called in and suggested that a considerable part 
of the Negro's problem was his poor performance in 
school -- primarily because he doesn't put much time in 
the three Rs, especially the first one. Jones immediately 
shifted into overdrive. Why, he screamed, it used to be a 
crime to teach a black child how to read, etc., etc. We've 
all heard it before. In the antebellum South it was indeed 
difficult for blacks to become literate, as Baraka pro­
claimed, but in their African homeland they had much 
more difficulty -- not because it was "against the law" but 
because they had no written language and consequently 
no books. 

D The other night I was watching the Tonight Show on one 
of those many occasions when Joan Rivers (nee Molinsky) 
was filling in for Johnny. Her final guest was Dr. Ruth 
Westheimer, the 4'7" German-Jewish sex therapist, who is 
fast acquiring a national reputation on the order of Dear 
Abby (nee Friedman) or Dr. Joyce Brothers (nee Rapoport). 
Within minutes the talk was of masturbation, clitoral and 
vaginal orgasms, erection dilemmas and all the other "inti­
mate" jargon we hear on media outlets trying to boost their 
ratings. Dr. Ruth's foul-mouthed rantings indicated the 
average Majority member's uneasiness about open discus­
sion of sexual matters. I couldn't help but reflect that this 
uneasiness -- and indeed the whole modern phenomenon 
of the Dr. Ruths and the mania for the public airing of 
matters once considered private -- is really very similar to 
the Buscaglia syndrome (lnstauration, April 1984). The 
Northern European, who has a natural reserve about sex­
ual concerns, especially in mixed company, is inherently 
predisposed to regard sex as an intensely private affair, 
with its proper situs being behind the proverbial closed 
doors. One cannot help but feel that this relentless drive 
toward stripping sex of its highly personal context, whether 
in Philip Roth's fiction or Dr. Ruth's "advice," is yet an­
other cultural imposition of the levant upon the West. The 
pressure makes us feel uncomfortable and guilty and per­
suades many of us to question our deepest (and best) 
instincts. Not only have we been pilloried for our racial 
exclusivity (racial privacy), but now we are being ridiculed 
for our habit of sexual privacy. 

D Bryant Gumbel's ostensible job is co-host of NBC's 
Today Show (Steve Friedman, producer). His real job is to 
hammer home the black-is-just-like-you-and-me myth 
into the minds of white Americans for two hours a day, five 
days a week, 52 weeks a year. We've come a long way, too 
long a way, from the days of Dave Garroway and Jack 
lescoulie. 

D Here is what a TV publication had to say last summer 
about the ABC series, Call to Glory. "Craig T. Nelson stars 
as Air Force Col. Raynor Sarnac, a half-Indian fighter jock­
ey with all the right stuff, both in the air and at home where 
his wife (Cindy Pickett) and three children live with the 
endless tension of his perilous profession." 

By the gods, the Colonel is half-Indian! That Nelson, 
who acts like a wooden Indian, has not one redskin in his 
family tree, is beside the point. The series was supposed to 

appeal to the "new patriotism." Having had some expo­
sure to American television, I knew in advance what vari­
ety of patriotism would be pushed. One episode I caught 
dealt with the Colonel's son and his black friend defending 
themselves against a gang of white racists. After a few 
minutes viewing of another segment about atrocities com­
mitted on Viet Cong prisoners ofwar by our South Vietnam 
allies, I tuned out for good. They never let up. 

D Rabbi Meir Kahane was on ABC's Nightline with Ted 
Koppel (Oct. 22, 1984). Contrary to the host's usual prac­
tice, the guest was given what was virtually a rhetorical 
carte blanche to explain his program (pogrom?) for an 
all-Jewish, zero-Arab Israel. Not one single question was 
asked. Imagine how Koppel would have reacted if the 
visiting racist had been a non-Jew. Ted's eyes would have 
squinted, his jaw would have clenched and said guest 
would have been peppered with so many hostile queries 
he'd hardly have been able to open his mouth. 

D Duringan interview on PBS (June 14,1981), actress Jane 
Alexander discussed her long association with The Great 
White Hope, one of the most popular race-mixing potboil­
ers. She played the white girlfriend of the black prize 
fighter, John Henry Johnson. In one melodramatic scene, 
after a ferocious argument with her black paramour, she 
commits suicide by jumping down a well. later the black 
"hero" goes into a sobbing fit over her body. Miss Alexan­
der recalled during the early 1960s, when audiences were 
overwhelmingly white, she would always hear accom­
panying sobs from the audience. But in the late 1960s, 
when the ticket buyers had become overwhelmingly 
black, the audience "cheered and laughed." 

Ponderable Quotes 

We advocate the preservation of conditions favourable to 
the growth of beautiful things -- imposing palaces, beautiful 
cities, elegant literature, reposeful art and music, and a physi­
cally select human type such as only luxury and a pure racial 
strain can produce. Thus we oppose democracy, if only 
because it would retard the development of a handsome 
Nordic breed. 

H.P. Lovecraft 

Can the whites succeed? How can they succeed if the 
gospel itself rejects everything that white society attempts to 
maintain and defend? How can the whites succeed if the 
gospel of liberation that Jesus Christ effects condemns white 
"Christianity"? ... This "Christian civilization" is estab­
lished on self-centeredness, selfishness, murder, and the theft 
of the land. 

Dr. Allan Boesak, President 
World Alliance of Reformed 
Churches 
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In spite of all he has done for Jewry, in 
spite of the billions upon billions he has 
heaped upon the state of Israel, 56% of 
Jews, says the New York Times (December 
3, 1984), still regard Reagan unfavorably. 
That's only four points less than their high 
disregard for Jesse Jackson. All of which 
demonstrates that the grandiose neocon­
servative Oewish) attempt to woo Jews to 
the Republ ican cause has been rather 
much of a failure. 

# 

From 1976, when the Supreme Court 
relaxed some of its restrictions on the death 
penalty, through 1984, 31 murderers have 
walked the last mile -- 10 blacks, 21 whites, 
no Jews. Today, 1,450 convicted murder­
ers (40% of them black) inhabit death rows 
in the 38 states which are not afraid to buck 
the liberal permissiveness that outlaws cap­
ital punishment and consequently encour­
ages capital crimes. 

# 

Ruth Love draws down $120,000 a year 
for presiding over the Chicago Public 
School System, the student body of which 
is now only 15% white. The contract of the 
highest-paid school superintendent in the 
country expired on March 25 and the Chi­
cago School Board voted not to renew it. 
Claiming she was fired because she was 
"black and female," Love has filed a $4.5 
million suit against the country's second 
biggest municipal disaster. 

# 

State legislators in Alaska pocket 
$48,000 annually; in New York, $43,000; 
in New Hampshire, $100. Alaska lawmak­
ers sit and supposedly work for 120 days a 
year; New York, 2 to 4 days weekly for six 
months; New Hampshire, 45 days a year. 

# 

Japan so far has accepted only a few 
hundred refugees a year from Southeast 
Asia, in contrast to the 700,000 taken in by 
the U.S. and the hundreds of thousands 
resettled in Canada, Malaysia, China, Aus­
tralia, Thailand and France. A few months 
ago Japan finally -- and grudgingly -­
agreed to raise its Southeast Asia refugee 
quota to 5,000 a year. 

# 

14 male prisoners in a Kansas City (Mis­
souri) prison have charged they were strip­
searched by women guards. The warden 
was not moved. He said the local prison 
system would not change its habit of treat­
ing men and women guards exactly alike. 
To make strip-searches of men the exclu­
sive duty of men would be rank sexism. 
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A few years after the 1917 Bolshevik 
putsch,Harbin, once but no longer the Paris 
of Manchuria, had a population of 100,000 
White Russians. Now it has fewer than 65. 

# 

Talk about Adolf's bunker! The West 
German government has built a $1.7 bil­
lion nuclear bomb shelter 1,000 feet under 
the Ahr Valley. It can house and feed 3,000 
politicians and bureaucrats for two years. 
The 18-mile maze of tunnels include some 
that were used for assembling V-2 rockets 
inWW11. 

# 

Roger Ebert, an otherwise intelligent Chi­
cago movie critic, wrote disingenuously in 
the Sun-Times (Sept. 27, 1984), he had 
"learned that 41 years ago there were 
800,000 Jewish farmers living in Hungary, 
and that today only 20 of their descendants 
still survive. The rest were the victims of 
Hitler ... . " Before the war there were less 
than 450,000 Jews in Hungary (American 
Jewish Yearbook, 194 1-42). As for farmers, 
Jews have never been known to crowd into 
that poorly-recompensed line of work. 

# 

One vice-president, 4 governors, 43 
mayors, 44 judges, 60 legislators and 260 
sheriffs and policemen were indicted for 
corruption in the 1970s. (John T. Noonan 
Jr., Bribes, Macmillan, 1984) 

# 

There were 6,250,613,000 crossings of 
U.S. borders by visitors, citizens and per­
manent resident aliens between 1941 and 
1980, according to INS records. The ten­
digit figure does not include the goings and 
com ings (mostly com i ngs) of illegal al iens. 

# 

Boston Latin School's 2,300 students 
must take at least 5 years of Lati n and some­
what less Greek (the language, that is, of 
Aeschylus, not Melina Mercouri). Before 
the day of desegregation dawned, minority 
students comprised less than 10% of the 
student body (grades 7-12). Today they're 
30%, a feat accomplished by devising two 
different entrance exams -- one for whites, 
one for blacks and Hispanics. Neverthe­
less, 40% of minority students embarras­
singly drop out by the end of their first year. 
Boston Latin may decide to solve this prob­
lem by two different graduation standards. 
This may work for Latin and Greek in a 
vestigial learning establishment, but what 
about two different standards for a civil 
engineering degree at MIT? On that day 
ferries on the Hudson River and San Fran­
cisco Bay will become very popular again. 

In 1953, 2 billion unscared passengers 
rode the graffiti-splattered Zoo City sub­
way. By last year the number had dropped 
to 1 billion terrified riders. What used to 
cost a nickel not so long ago now costs 90¢. 

# 

Hassanal Bolkiah, the Sultan of Brunei 
(population 210,000), lives with a pack of 
fawning courtiers in a $500-million plea­
sure dome of 1,788 rooms. He is now 
building a separate palace for his second 
wife. 

# 

The Smithsonian Institution's plans to 
build a $75-million Islamic art and cultural 
center underneath the Washington Mall is 
being held up by Rep. Sidney Yates (D-IL), 
who is worried about security and whether 
a Saudi subsidy of the project has "any 
strings attached." The Jewish congressman 
had no objection whatever to the construc­
tion of an equally expensive Holocaust 
memory jogger only a few blocks away. 

# 

Racial, religious and occupational run­
down on the 99th Congress: 

House Senate 
Women 110,1"1 R 2R 
Hispanics 120 0 
Blacks 200 0 
Catholics 820,43 R 11 0,8 R 
Jews 230,7 R 40,5 R 
Lawyers 1210,69 R 320,29 R 

Two of the Hispanics listed above and 
one the blacks are non-voting delegates, 
representing, respectively, Puerto Rico, 
Virgin Islands and District of Columbia. 
The Jewish count exceeds the "official" 
media figure by 1 in both the House and 
Senate. Instauration defines Rep. Mickey 
Edwards of Oklahoma and Sen. William 
Cohen of Maine as Jews, even though the 
former has converted to Christianity and 
the latter did not have a Jewish mother. 

# 

Saudi Arabia has given $700,000 to Is­
rael for make-work projects in Bethlehem. 
The birthplace of Jesus has a Palestinian 
Arab mayor. 

# 

In the 5 years ending Oct. 31, 1984, 
Washington Post newsmen resorted to the 
term "far right" 390 times; "far left" 131; 
"ultraright" 47; "ultraleft" 12; "ultracon­
servative" 74; "ultraliberal" 27. 56% of 
stories dealing with extremists referred to 
rightists,S % to leftists. II Archconservative" 
appeared in 58 Post pieces; " archliberal" 
in on /y 1. I n the TV network coverage ofthe 
presidential campaign, "far right" was used 
10 times more frequently than "far left." 
(Conservative Digest, Jan. 1985, p. 47) 



Rep. WILLIAM GRAY III (D-PA) is the 
new chairman of the House Budget Com­
mittee, not exactly an uninfluential post in 
these high-deficit times. But it is doubtful if 
the black congressman will fire up any 
campaign to cut anything except defense. 
Gray is an ordained minister of the Baptist 
Bright Hope Church of North Philadelphia, 
where he preaches regularly. Church and 
state? Being a big-city Negro, he has noth­
ing to worry about. It's only right-wing 
white preachers who are ordered by the 
New York Times to get out or stay out of 
politics. 

An outfit that calls itself the ISRAELI 
COMMANDOS and claims to have cells in 
Buffalo, Cleveland and Pittsburgh has 
warned the town fathers of Hayden Lake, 
Idaho, that they better get rid of the Aryan 
Nations Church "in six months" or "we 
will go in and rid you of them once and for 
all." 

On page 606 of the Irish American 
Who's Who Archbishop JOHN J. O'CON­
NOR (NYC) lists as one of his achievements 
and honors his selection as "B'nai B'rith 
Man ofthe Year"! 

ANGELA DAVIS, the perennial Commu­
nist Party candidate for Vice-President, has 
been ordered by a San Diego judge to pay 
$2,212, which represents interest and prin­
cipal on the defaulted 3% student loan that 
she received way back in 1967 when she 
was enrolled in the University of Cal ifornia. 
Davis is now a well-paid professor at San 
Francisco State University. 

From sundown Friday to sundown Satur­
day, the lift in RENEE REICHMANN's man­
sion in Vancouver, B.C., moves automati­
cally every ten minutes from the first to the 
second floor and back again. This "Sabbath 
elevator" is designed to raise and lower the 
82-year-old millionairess without the ne­
cessity of her touching the elevator button, 
one of the myriad forms of work forbidden 
to Orthodox Jews and Jewesses on thei r 
Day of Rest. The Reichmanns arrived in 
Canada from France by way of Morocco 30 
years ago. Today the family has amassed 
some $13 billion in assets. Just one of their 
businesses, Olympia York, the real estate 
investment firm of which Renee is chair­
person, makes a profit of $700,000 a day. 
The Reichmanns are the moneybags be­
hind the Simon Wiesenthal Holocaust 
racket in Los Angeles. 

At least he had good taste in women. 
MICHAEL J. MATTHEWS, the former At­
lantic City mayor who was sentenced on 
New Year's Eve to 15 years in prison for 
"selling his office" to organized crime, had 
been tape-recorded by undercover federal 
agents. At one meeting in the West Indies, 
while sipping drinks with an FBI man, the 
playboy-official recalled judging a Miss 
Penthouse beauty contest: "Boy, you ought 
to see the girls from these ... countries. 
The girl from South Africa is a doll baby. A 
gi rI from, it used to be Rhodesia ... a doll 
baby. The girl from Canada is no slouch, 
either." 

On December 15, the professional fra­
ternity SIGMA PI PHI held a private dinner­
dance at the Philadelphia Art Museum for 
120 of its elite black members and their 
friends. The next morning, a $100,000 oil 
painting was missing. A police source re­
ported that security had been very lax: 
"Some of the men had briefcases and no­
body was searched, and guests had the run 
of the place. The guards felt intimidated by 
all these important people in tuxes and eve­
ning gowns." On the assumption that the 
painting was "too hot" to remain in Penn­
sylvania, the FBI entered the case, and sub­
poenaed the guest list of 120, which in­
cluded Mayor Wilson Goode. 

Miami's Puerto Rican mayor, Maurice 
Ferre, is annoyed by some of the rosy re­
porting on local race relations. "Blacks and 
Cubans don't get along just fine," he says. 
"There is antipathy." What bothers Ferre 
most is the media coverage of the city's 
periodic race riots, epitomized for him by a 
picture in the French magazine PARIS 
MATCH, which showed black youths car­
rying a casket: "What they were doing was 
looting, putting goods into the casket. But 
the caption with the picture said, 'Three 
Miami blacks carry one of their fallen com­
rades.' " 

She only did what people have been shot 
for doing in other wars .... JANE FONDA, 
now 46, who damned America from Hanoi 
in 1972, is now turning up in opinion polls 
as perhaps the most popular female enter­
tainer in the land. "Opportunities to gen­
erate vast amounts of money pop up right 
and left," writes John M. Wilson in the 
Chicago Tribune, "and she has seized 
many of them." (Compare the economic 
fate of Anita Bryant, a nationally known 
personality before she spoke out against 
"gay rights.") 

Two white Louisville youths got lost in 
the local ghetto on their way to a football 
game last fall. They kept stopping to ask 
directions. At about 9 P.M., two black 
toughs named GEORGE WADE and VIC­
TOR TAYLOR abducted them in a restau­
rant parking lot. Next came robbery, sodo­
my and a couple offatal shots in each white 
head. 

The most ambitious pol in New York 
may be Manhattan borough president AN­
DREW STEIN, who wants to be the first 
Jewish President. Stein's rich father, JERRY 
FINKELSTEIN, founder of the New York 
Law Journal, was a pal of NElSON ROCK­
EFELLER, who helped get young Andrew 
appointed to the chairmanship of an im­
portant state committee. Last fall, Stein, 
now 39, contested the East Side Manhattan 
congressional seat of Bill Green, a liberal 
Jewish Republican. New York's 15th or 
"Silk Stocking" District has the highest per 
capita income among the 435 congression­
al districts nationwide, and has served as 
the launching pad for politicians like JOHN 
LINDSAY and ED KOCH. Appropriately, 
Green vs. Stein probably outspent most of 
the other 434 races. Voter eyebrows were 
raised over the vast sums contributed to 
Stein by the same real estate firms which 
also take a lively interest in his zoning deci­
sions as borough president. This may ex­
plain why Mr. Ambition got only 44% of 
the vote. 

Wall Street swindler JOHN EFLER has 
been sentenced to 20 years in prison. Over 
a two-year period, while employed by the 
Prudential-Bache brokerage firm, he issued 
$18.9 million in dividend checks to bogus 
companies, which then kicked back half 
the loot to him. With his $9 million share, 
Efler consumed most conspicuously, while 
investing in a lesbian bar, a gay bar, a sex 
club and a "sex art gallery." He also paid a 
mobster half a million for "protection." 
$5.5 million remains unaccounted for. 
Since Prudential-Bache's loss was covered 
by an Aetna insurance policy, all us little 
people will long be paying for Efler's gam­
bl i ngf prostitutes, race horses, flashy cars 
and overpriced jewelry. 

Convicted of draft dodging, once con­
sidered the most heinous of crimes, MU­
HAMMAD (Cassius Clay) ALI nevertheless 
maintains his hero status. In fact, some 
years ago the politically hep Supreme 
Court even went out of its way to reverse 
the lower court's verdict. Now the punch­
drunk ex-World Heavyweight Boxing 
Champ is suing the government for $50 
million for refUSing to classify him as a con­
scientious objector during the Vietnam 
fiasco. 
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As Instauration has already pointed out, 
the new junior senator from Illinois, PAUL 
SIMON, who claims to be a Lutheran, has 
let it be widely known that he has pinned a 
mezuza on his doorpost. Not to be out­
done, another non-Jewish legislator, Rep. 
MARK SILJANDER of Michigan, has in­
formed the media that he displays a mezu­
za with its scriptural jewish homily at the 
entrance of his congressional suite of of­
fices. As reinsurance, the born-again Chris­
tian congressman has a second mezuza 
tacked on the door of his personal office. 

For many years World Publishing was 
the world's leading seller of the King james 
Bible. A few months ago DAVID ZEVIN, 
who headed the publishing house from 
1945 to 1966, expired in Miami Beach. He 
was a national director of Americans for 
Democratic Action and prominent in Jew­
ish community affairs. 

FIDEL CASTRO'S SON has just complet­
ed a visit to Israel. Since the Israeli foreign 
ministry is practically a wholly owned sub­
sidiary ofthe U.S. State Department (or vice 
versa), this may be a sign that U.S.-Cuban 
relations are on the mend. Already Papa 
Castro has agreed to take back 2,746 of the 
25,000 or 30,000 criminals, mentally ill 
and other misfits that came here on the 
Mariel boatlift. The catch, the big catch, is 
that the U.S. will now accept 3,000 more 
Cuban political prisoners, as well as ap­
proximately 300,000 family members of 
the 100,000 or so Marielitos who are being 
given permanent resident status. This re­
newed immigration from Cuba probably 
means the end of Miami as anything ap­
proaching an American city, since most 
Cubans settle there. 

As the 1984 presidential election ap­
proached, NANCY REAGAN was told to 
cool her constant socializing with the likes 
of BETSY BLOOMINGDALE, wife of the 
late Diner's Club pervert, and JERRY ZIP­
KIN, a Zoo City flutterbug. After the elec­
toral landslide, she immediately took up 
with her dear friends again and now sees 
them more than ever. 

The U.S. government charged that HAR­
OLD ROSENTHAL, 53, ran the biggest co­
caine smuggling ring in history. In Novem­
ber a court sentenced him to life and a 
$425,000 fine. Rosenthal claimed, unsuc­
cessfully, that he had been working for the 
CIA. 
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Brooklyn District Attorney ELIZABETH 
HOLTZMAN, the nation's leading female 
Nazi hunter, inexplicably dropped charges 
against 15 landlords and real estate people 
and two "torchers" for burning several oc­
cupied buildings and plotting to burn ten 
others in a multimillion-dollar arson-for­
profit scam. During the investigation Holtz­
man refused to testify about misconduct 
charges against her office which arose in 
the course of a 4-year investigation. One of 
those let off the hook was Rabbi Abraham 
Siochowsky, a former principal of a Brook­
lyn jewish school, who has already been 
convicted of arson and racketeering and is 
now in prison. Holtzman, who recently 
made a headline-loaded tripto Paraguay to 
find Josef Mengele, the Auschwitz saw­
bones, seems more interested in prosecut­
ing an aged German refugee, or his ghost, 
than criminals in her own backyard. 

LUIS RIVERA, 14, was arrested for the 
murder of Barbara Purvis, a 37-year-old 
mother of two, who was dragged from a 
Brooklyn street while returning from a bin­
go game and raped and stabbed to death in 
the foyer of a housing project -- within 
earshot and eyeshot of dozens of apartment 
dwellers. The rape-murder took all of 15 
minutes, during which time the onlookers 
did nothing to help the dying woman. No 
one even bothered to call the police until 
Mrs. Purvis was practically dead. 

It was inevitable. ZE'EV CHAFETS, born 
in Wisconsin, currently the director of the 
Israeli Government Press Office, has writ­
ten Double Vision: How the Press Distorts 
America's View of the Middle East (Mor­
row, $16.95). The author'S thesis is thatthe 
American media have been unfairto Israel. 

Between January 1980 and the summer 
of 1984, $2.7 million in federal aid was 
given to the Greater Pittsburgh Business 
Development Corporation, an agency os­
tensibly created to help minority-owned 
firms compete in the marketplace. A recent 
audit determined that nearly $800,000 was 
misspent, and, additionally, that nearly 
50% of the $1.3 million in loans granted 
had ended in default. It is now believed that 
some of the defaulting firms never existed. 
BURREL A. BROWN was the black presi­
dent of the agency during those years, but 
he and his staff have not yet been charged 
with any crime. At last report Brown, a 
former NAACP chapter president, was still 
active in community affairs and had been 
nominated for the presidency of a black 
lawyers' group. 

After a media blitz in the U.S. and Europe 
for receiving the Nobel Prize and for his 
support of anti-white black terrorists in 
South Africa, BISHOP DESMOND TUTU 
flew off, not to starving Ethiopia, where 
blacks really need help, but to South Africa, 
where they enjoy the highest living stan­
dard of all their racial cousins anywhere on 
the continent. What Tutu didn't tell West­
ern audiences is that South African blacks, 
not South African whites, have been the 
principal killers of blacks of late. Deputy 
Mayor Sam Dlamini was recently hacked 
to death by 12 black radicals. Deputy May­
or Phillemon Diphoko of Evaton was 
stoned to death by 40 black militants. May­
or A.P. Kuhlamo of Katlehong was fire­
bombed, together with his family, by 
blacks who accused him of selling out to 
whites. Altogether more than 30 black 
mayors or lesser politicians have been as­
saulted by fellow blacks in the last three 
months. 

The District of Columbia is planning to 
issue $1 billion in bonds. Watergater John 
Mitchell, a specialist in the municipal bond 
business, said he was against the idea until 
Mayor MARION BARRY and his cronies 
stopped running their welfare fief "like the 
Amos 'n' Andy Taxicab Company." DA­
VID CLARK, the chairman of the D.C. 
Council, a white who keeps a cautious 
weather eye out for the black vote, de­
nounced Mitchell's statement as "racist." 

DAN RATHER recently spent some of his 
precious air time on the Ogorodnikovs, a 
Russian couple who had inveigled Richard 
W. Miller, an FBI agent and excommuni­
cated Mormon, into becomi ng a Soviet spy. 
What Injun Dan failed to relate was that 
Nikolay Ogorodnikov was really a Russian 
refusenik named Wolfson, who adopted 
his Gentile wife's name aftertheir marriage. 

It was so nice and reassuring after the 
Miss America contretemps to have a decent 
young black lady like KRISTINA KAYE 
SMITH as Queen of the 1985 Pasadena 
Tournament of Roses. So nice and reassur­
ing until it came out she had been fired 
from her sales clerk job a few months ear­
lier for placing $21 she had received from a 
customer not in the cash register where it 
belonged, but under the counter where the 
money could eventually belong to anyone, 
maybe even her. For this LA. police gave 
Smith a petty theft citation. Nevertheless, 
the show had to go on. Tournament of 
Roses officials, thankfu Iat least that she had 
not posed for hardcore lesbian pictures, 
cheered the Queen as she wore her crown 
proudly in the New Year's Day Parade. 



Canada. To speed up its transformation 
into a police state (two Mounties recently 
marched into a university library and re­
moved the banned book of Arthur Butz, 
The Hoax of the Twentieth Century), Can­
ada has now reduced the top weight of 
first-class mail coming into the country 
from 17.6 to 1.05 ounces. This gives Cana­
dian customs officials a much greater op­
portunity for snooping for "dangerous" lit­
erature, since the law forbids them from 
opening first-class mail. 

Britain. A 17-year-old office worker, a 
virgin, was assaulted and raped in London 
last autumn by her Kenyan-born cab driver 
-- and then charged an excess fare! "Iliketo 
do this to white girls," Warejit Kholi said 
during the attack. "I hope you get pregnant 
and have a boy." After the cabbie deflow­
ered her, he promised to burn down her 
parents' home if she told anyone. She had 
the pluck to disobey him. Most shamefully, 
Kholi received only a 4 Y2-year sentence 
after pleading guilty. 

* * * 

The white reaction against the nonwhite 
crime wave in London has been incredibly 
subdued -- throwing stones, breaking win­
dows, shouting epithets. Yet because the 
latter actions are deemed "racist," they are 
being harshly dealt with by authorities. The 
latest threat of the leftist Greater London 
Council (GLC) is to have all those charged 
with "racial harassment" evicted from 
public housing. (Confessed rapists may 
stay.) 

Recently, the Bangladeshi tenants in two 
housing estates grew tired of finding eggs, 
dog excrement and other refuse hurled 
against their doors and windows. Conse­
quently, six large brown families have actu­
ally moved out. This minor demographic 
miracle has members of the local "Race 
and Housing Action Team" in a dither. 
Having already given away much of Bri­
tain's scarce public housing to aliens, they 
are now resolved to take much more from 
those remaining whites who, every day, are 
forcing themselves to go out and curse, spit, 
whistle, bang on doors and "look menac­
ing" in a deliberate ploy to assure thattheir 
great-grandchildren will be white. 

* * 

Last November, the GLC awarded a 
£95,000 grant to a group of seven women 
and one man whose job will be to provide 
"good quality anti-racist and anti-sexist 
play activities" for the local two-to-four­
year-old set. Babies Against Racism is the 
theme. Pro-black, pro-"ethnic" and pro-fe­
male images are to be built into all toys, 
puzzles and games provided for toddlers. A 
second aim of the grant is to "encourage 

the involvement of lesbian women working 
with children." Chairing the GLC Wo­
men's Committee which awarded the 
funds was one Valerie Wise. Her report 
stated that the eight recipients found it in­
creasingly hard to maintain their multira­
cial enthusiasm while waiting 22 months 
for the money. Touching .... 

* * * 

An equally vile group is the Inner Lon­
don Education Authority (ILEA), which, by 
September, will require all local students to 
use a new "anti-racist" mathematics cur­
riculum. In place of the old apples and 
oranges problems will be the following: 

• Calculate ratios of population to land 
among the different racial groups in South 
Africa. 

• Draw graphs showing racial unem­
ployment rates in Britain. (But not graphs 
showing IQ or fertility, crime and immigra­
tion rates!) 

• Determine profit margins of Western 
multinational corporations doing business 
in Third World countries. 

Tory Professor David Smith accuses the 
ILEA of promoting "Marxism" through 
mathematics. However, nothing this sinis­
ter was ever taught in any Russian math 
class. And why does Professor Smith bad­
mouth poor Karl Marx, a Germanophile 
who believed in Negro inferiority? Why not 
call "anti-white racism" by its correct 
name? 

Smith is right to observe, "If ideas like 
this gather pace then people will be moving 
out of London because they won't want this 
sort of education for their children." 

That, indeed, is the whole idea: not con­
version (impossible), but replacement. The 
minority and Third World hordes stand to 
inherit a majestic, white-built city where 
none but the wealthiest and most insulated 
of whites will dare or care to live. 

* * * 

The London madness is unending. The 
Lambeth Council of South London has 
been trying to rename Rhodesia Road as 
Zimbabwe Road as part of GLC's "Anti­
Racism Year." Hardly any real Englishmen 
still live on this street filled with blacks, 
Poles, Italians, Irish, Russian Jews and God­
knows-what-not, yet the few English "sur­
vivors" -- like everyone else -- are indig­
nant about the proposal. 

Tory MP Sir Geoffrey Finsberg de­
nounced the GLC's "hypocrisy" for cham­
pioning "democracy" when "here we 
have the democratic wishes of the people 
of Rhodesia Road being totally ignored be­
cause it does not fit in with the theories of 
the Left." Yes, Sir Geoffrey, but were "the 

democratic wishes" of the displaced En­
glishmen and women of Rhodesia ever 
consulted? 

* * * 

The same concern with petty traditions, 
at the expense of living flesh and blood, 
turned up in Birmingham recently, where 
the first woman Lord Mayor, Mrs. Marjorie 
Brown, is upset because the headmistress 
of her old girls' school is trying to ban the 
school song because it (allegedly) "smacks 
too much of Empire": 

Where the iron heart of England 
Throbs beneath its sombre robe 

Stands a school whose girls have made her 
Great and famous round the globe. 

The head, Miss Anne Percival, explains: 
"The song was written before the school 
had any coloured pupils. Now we have a 
small number and that certainly influenced 
my thinking." Lord Mayor Brown, who has 
never decried the unsought browning of 
her city, says, "I don't want the song 
changed. I am a traditionalist in things like 
this." 

France. From a Parisian Instaurationisl. A 
perfect instance of the embarrassment of 
the French media vis-a-vis Jean-Marie Le 
Pen is the admission of Le Quotidien de 
Paris, an influential right-wing daily, that 
his 1984 election victories made him 
France's fourth "Man of the Year." At pre­
sent Le Pen is winning all his libel actions 
against the various left-wing and minority 
fanatics who have accused him of being a 
fascist or Nazi. This is nottoo difficult a task 
since he is basically a French nationalist 
who contends a minimum amount of order 
and morality are necessary for the survival 
of the Republic. The media, however, con­
sider him both dangerous and nutty be­
cause he praises values which only 50 
years ago were the common stock in trade 
of every Western country. French patriots-­
less than 50% of the population -- are gravi­
tating toward him in ever greater numbers 
and wou Id gravitate much faster if he 
were allowed another hour on TV. Right 
now Le Pen, though given the electronic 
si lent treatment, conti nues to receive more 
than a 10% approval rating nationwide. 
Meanwhile, the other political parties are 
helping themselves to plank after plank 
from his political platform. In the latest poll 
in Perpignan, an important city in the south 
of France, he and his anti-immigration 
campaign were viewed favorably by more 
than 44% of the voters. Unfortunately, Le 
Pen is beset with some personal problems. 
H is wife, Pierrette, has left him for a sympa­
thizer of the Front National. Pierette was a 
starlet Jean-Marie took up with when he 
was a college student. They have three at­
tractive girls with nice Nordic complex­
ions. Pierrette was very courageous during 
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the many times her husband was bombed 
or attacked, but she never had any serious 
interest in pol itics. The way she dressed has 
always been an embarrassment to a politi­
cian seeking the support of the most moral 
sector of the French population, though Le 
Pen himself is no model of Puritanism. 

* * * 

The French government is practically 
overrun with Jews: Trigano, the Club Medi­
terranee tycoon, is now Minister for Indus­
try, and Pisani, a Jewish Maltese with Bri­
tish nationality, has been given full powers 
to solve the New Caledonian mess. As ex­
pected, he is leaning away from the French 
settlers and leaning toward the native Ka­
nakas, who had barely advanced beyond 
the coconut stage of civilization until the 
French arrived. Pisani suggested that as the 
New Caledonia poll provided the pro­
French, anti-Independence group with an 
enormous majority, new polls should be 
initiated based on race. This is 100% 
against the French Constitution. It is amus­
i ng to watch the same people who defend 
this racist view for New Caledonia, deny­
ing it in F ra nce when it is a matter ofconsid­
ering Arabs, blacks and Jews as distinct 
communities. Apparently racism is good in 
New Caledonia when it works against 
Frenchmen, but bad in France when it 
works for Frenchmen. 

Many French have ignored the existence 
of New Caledonia -- a true South Pacific 
paradise -- which their ancestors claimed 
just over a hundred years ago. The popula­
tion consists of a minority of natives and-a 
majority of whites and crossbreeds. The 
victory of the independence-seeking Ka­
nakas would be a disaster for the hybrids as 
well as for the whites, since it would lead to 
a total col/apse of the economy. The final 
settlement will probably be an "associa­
tion" arrangement, somewhat similar to 
the relationship of New Zealand with the 
United Kingdom. If so, this would be a 
considerable victory for Mitterrand, who 
could then convince French opinion that 
he had succeeded where (in Algeria and 
Indo-China) his opponents had failed -- for­
getting, of course, that he was Minister of 
the Interior during the greater part of the 
Algerian war. 

* * * 
It turns out that France's most famous 

Nazi hunters, the Jewish Serge Klarsfeld 
and his brainwashed German wife, Beate, 
may have been a couple of wou Id-be assas­
sins. Klarsfeld has now both admitted and 
denied that he and Mrs. Klarsfeld paid a 
Bolivian hitman $5,000 as travel expenses 
to kill Klaus Barbie, the former Gestapo 
chief of Lyons, in 1982. There were several 
other people in on the plot, which was 
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cancelled at the last minute when a new 
Bolivian government agreed to Barbie's ex­
tradition (kidnapping) to France. 

Klarsfeld has no regrets about his in­
volvement in the attempted murder. "You 
can say I would pay the same for Brunner in 
Syria," he said, before he corrected himself 
a few days later. Brunner, a former aide to 
Adolf Eichmann, now supposedly resides 
in Damascus. 

In any civilized country, Klarsfeld would 
be brought to trial and handed a stiff jail 
sentence for joining a kidnapping conspir­
acy (a charge he freely admitted). But for 
Nazi hunters and Holocaust avengers, the 
criminal justice system has long ago been 
scrapped. They belong to a uniquely privi­
leged class which can commit any crime 
and spout any libel without the slightest 
fear of punishment. 

Austria. Walter Reder, often called "the 
last prisoner of World War II," is back 
home in Austria. As Instauration pointed 
out in an extensive article (May 1981), Re­
der is more sinned against than sinning. His 
"war crime" was to have commanded an 
55 battalion fighting Italian partisans in late 
1944 when German forces were retreating 
in northern Italy. In the course of an en­
gagement near the jerkwater town of Mar­
zabotto, where partisans had the active 
help of the local population, a lot of civil­
ians got killed after guerrillas had killed a 
lot of German soldiers. After the war the 
leftists and Communists in Italy blew up 
Marzabotto into a great hot-air balloon of 
anti-fascist agitprop, which terrorized a 
spineless Italian court into finding Reder 
guilty of war crimes, although he had been 
cleared by the British and Americans. 
When he was sentenced to life imprison­
ment, the Reds got thei r gallon of blood. 

In spite of a last minute, largely Jewish­
inspired worldwide press campaign, Reder 
was paroled last January after spending 37 
years in what was little better than a dun­
geon in Gaeta, Italy. On his return to his 
native country of Austria, he was greeted at 
the Graz military airport by Minister of De­
fense Friedheim Frischenschlager, who 
claimed the official reception had been ne­
cessary for security reasons. While the 
press screamed to high heaven, a gathering 
of the World Jewish Congress met in Vie"n­
na to seek "reconciliation with Austria after 
the Kreisky era." Zionist speakers recalled 
that Frischenschlager had been guilty of 
some "ambiguous" remarks about the 
Mauthausen concentration camp some­
time back, and muttered that his Freedom 
Party had a substantial number of ex-Nazi 
members. Threats were made that the 
World Jewish Congress would leave Vien­
na if Chancellor Sinowatz did not person­
ally apologize. This Sinowatz did, looking 

like a fat schoolboy on TV as he sat in the 
front row and was told off by "President 
Bronfman./f After this, Frischenschlager 
had to beg pardon in writing for his "grave 
political mistake," and it was interesting to 
see which politicians ganged up to demand 
his dismissal. As usual, prominent politicos 
of the "conservative" People's Party were 
very much to the fore, and its leader, Alois 
Mock, tabled a resolution declaring no 
confidence in Frischenschlager. But the 
scales were turned in Frischenschlager's 
favor when the leaderofthe Freedom Party, 
Norbert Steger, threatened to leave the co­
alition if Frischenschlager had to resign. 
Socialists like to keep their snouts in the 
trough, and the departure of the Freedom 
Party would have entailed new elections. 

Even in the Freedom Party voices were 
raised against Frischenschlager, but sup­
port for him remained solid in Salzburg and 
in Carinthia, while a national press confer­
ence of the party at Linz decided he had 
acted correctly. Clearly, Jewish pressure on 
the Austrians was proving to some extent 
counterproductive, but the usual Jewish 
calculation is that the Jews will be more 
persistent long-term, and so will win out. 
We shall see. Meanwhile, Foreign Minister 
Gratz deserves some credit for stating on 
TV that he was answerable to the govern­
ment and not to any foreign organization. 

At present Reder is resting in a hospital, 
where he spent his 70th birthday. He lost 
part of his left arm in the battle of Kharkov 
in 1943 and part of his stomach as the result 
of a digestive ailment. One leg was gravely 
injured in his battles with the Italian parti­
sans. Since he is not likely to enjoy his 
late-in-life freedom too long, let us wish 
him some happiness in his last days and let 
us grant him his desire "to die in silence." 
In his prime he was one of the handsomest 
officers on any side of the Second Nordic 
Internecine War. 

Reder before it all happened 



Major Reder gave practically the best 
years of his life to his country. For that he is 
now without honor in his country. If he is a 
war criminal because his men killed civil­
ians who were aiding ununiformed guerril­
las against the rules of modern warfare and 
had been ambushing and killing German 
soldiers, what does that make Churchill for 
ordering an all-out air attack on the civil­
ian-jammed, undefended city of Dresden, 
which produced the single greatest massa­
cre in world history (anywhere from 
125,000 to 250,000 killed)? What does that 
make Truman, who ordered the incinera­
tion of the undefended city of Hiroshima 
(some 100,000 dead)? It is ou r bet that if the 
Germans had won the war, Churchill and 
Truman would probably have lived out 
their lives in safe but humble circum­
stances. The Nazis, when they overran 
France, didn't sentence French generals to 
death and they didn't hang or torture one of 
their bitterest enemies, ex-Preimer Leon 
Blum. Why is it that Roosevelt, Churchill 
and Stalin had to kill or jail their military 
and political counterparts? Would they 
have done so if there had been no Jews 
whispering in' their ears? Indeed, would 
they have gone to war at all if there had 
been no such whispering in their midst? 

Gibraltar. Chief Minister Sir Joshua Has­
san and Mayor Abraham Serfaty are two of 
the 600 Jews who inhabit The Rock, the 
total population of which is 30,000. 

Greece. A trial court in Iraklion, Crete, 
recently took a very unpluralistic attitude in 
sustaining the Greek Orthodox Church's 
complaint that the Brooklyn-based Jeho­
vah's Witnesses sect was an organization 
akin "to Judaism aiming at the creation of 
the world Zionist empire with jerusalem at 
its center." 

Granting an unusual petition from the 
Holy Archdiocese of Crete, the civil court 
scotched formal state recognition of the es­
tablishment of a "Christian Church of Jeho­
vah's Witnesses of Crete," finding the pros­
elytizing cult part of a sinister conspiracy 
"against Christianity and the nation," and 
bent on imposing a "theocratic Zionist 
state" in which some members would be 
"appointed as governors of the most im­
portant areas of the world and that the ruler 
of Jerusalem will be issuing directions con­
cerning world affairs." 

This most unecumenical ruling immedi­
ately touched off the usual flurry of recrimi­
nations from organized Jewry whenever 
the Great Wall of Mind Control is publicly 
breached. Jozef Lovinger, President of the 
Central Board of Jewish Communities in 
Greece, reflexively denounced the ruling 
as "sheer nonsense," and expressed alarm 
that such judicial pronouncements would 
add fuel to the propaganda of Eu ropean 
reactionary elements. Israel Singer, Execu­
tive Director of the World Jewish Congress, 

put pressure on the socialist Papandreou 
regime, already on very thin ice for its ra­
ther mild utterances of Palestinian support 
and for serving as host for the 1984 Gad­
dafi-Mitterrand negotiations, to officially 
distance itself from the errant Iraklion court 
in deepest, nearly Jewless, Crete. 

While the Jews ofGreece were described 
as "angered and disturbed" by the ruling, 
local public and press opinion supported it. 
Increasing numbers of incidents like these 
may cause some of the Chosen to wish for a 
return to the old days under the "anti-Se­
mitic" nationalist Colonels, many of whom 
remain interred. 

Russia. Svetlana Alliluyeva is back in 
Moscow after a long, turbulent exile in the 
U.s. One reason for the return of Stalin's 
daughter to her native hearth, explained 
the London Jewish Chronicle (Nov. 23, 
1984), was her desire to see son Joseph 
Morosov, 39, a Moscow heart specialist. 
joseph is the offspring of her first marriage 
to Joseph Moroz, a Russian jew, a marriage 
Father Joe called a "Zionist plot," as Svet­
lana elucidated in her book, Twenty Letters 
to a Friend. Stalin had another jewish 
grandchild, the daughter of his son, jacob, 
who died in a German prisoner-of-war 
camp, and julia, a Russian Jewess whose 
last name was not furnished by the world's 
haughtiest and prissiest jewish journal (ex­
cluding the New York Times). 

Poland. Adam Schaff, the "Polish" Com­
munist Party's leading theoretician during 
the grim postwar years, who was finally 
expelled from the Party after having be­
come too much of a "Marxist" and not 
enough of a "Communist" (Elsewhere, Oc­
tober 1984), was in the news again recent­
ly. The shrewd, only half-truckling, politi­
cal commentators, Rowland Evans and 
Robert Novak, devoted their column of De­
cember 13 to a secret letter which Schaff 
sent to General Jaruzelski in 1983. The 30­
page epistle warned the general of the 
grave danger he faced from "neo-Stalinist" 
(Le., pro-Russian) hard-liners within the 
Polish party. He should have purged them 
all in December 1981, said Schaff, when 
martial law was first declared, but, not hav­
ing done so, would likely be toppled by 
them if they ever got the chance. Should 
that happen, the Polish army would prob­
ably side with the people, which would 
guarantee Russian military intervention, 
war and, conceivably, the "liquidation of 
Polish statehood." 

Schaff's letter to Jaruzelski was smuggled 
to the West in November of last year. As 
Evans and Novak cautioned, his motives in 
sending it are "shrouded." Right up' until 
his expu Ision from the party in 1983, Schaff 
was seen by Moscow as an "anti-revision­
ist" Marxist-Leninist purist with close ties to 
the Kremlin. Evans and Novak speculate 
that "he may have been changed by Po­

land's brief glory during the daring days of 
Solidarity," but it seems more likely that his 
change, and the entire Solidarity phenome­
non itself, are both symptoms of a glacially 
slow "inversion" (of sorts) which has been 
occurring in world politics -- toward na­
tionalism and cultural conservatism in the 
Red East and toward rootless cosmopoli­
tanism and born-again capitalism in the 
West. Each Jewish intellectual will have his 
own breaking point as this drawn-out ideo­
logical realignment proceeds, but most are 
shifting their sympathies even further to­
ward the West. 

Schaff's letter to Jaruzelski warned that 
the fi rst danger sign wou Id be an attempt to 
isolate him in the Polish Politburo by cut­
ting down his close allies. Foreign Minister 
Stefan Olszowski and secret pol ice boss 
General Miroslaw Mikewski were seen as 
dangerous, while Interior Minister Czeslaw 
Kiszczak, a good friend, was felt to be vul­
nerable. 

Perhaps the letter partly explains the un­
precedented public trial of four members of 
the secret police in the murder of Father 
Popieluszko, which has seen all Poland riv­
eted to its radios. The unique force of Polish 
nationalist sentiment also helped to make 
the trial possible; a leading Polish novelist 
says it would have been unthinkable "in 
any other East-bloc country." Although the 
chief prosecutor behaved at times like an 
attorney for the accused, the pro-Russian 
hard-liners were badly embarrassed and 
pushed back nonetheless, when all four 
defendants were found guilty. It is said that 
General Mikewski may soon be out of a 
job. 

Perhaps the role of Adam Schaff in this 
great national drama has been overrated by 
some. Perhaps the only reason we hear 
about him and what may have been an 
utterly inconsequential letter is that he or 
his wife has the inevitable "cousin in 
Brooklyn." Who can say? jews often boast 
of their power to shape events; their foes 
usually take them at their word; but maybe 
at times they are the only bird on the ele­
phant's back, who imagines that he directs 
the lumbering beast. 

Romania. The great danger of small na­
tional minorities who do not behave as well 
as the majority is that the situation can only 
be rectified in one of two ugly ways: either 
the majority must take harsh coercive mea­
sures against the minority, or it must de­
scend to the minority's level of behavior to 
maintain its place. The present Gypsy pop­
ulation explosion in Romania brings this 
home. 

Wh ite activists are right to screech about 
European fertility rates when they slump to 
outrageous, suicidal levels like 1.3 children 
per women, as in West Germany. But the 
moderately low levels of 1.9 to 2.1 children 
per women which prevail in countries like 
Romania are actually not a bad thing in 

INSTAURATION -- APRIL 1985 -- PAGE 33 



themselves. The good European earth 
needs a chance to recuperate, as the shock­
ing, Hiroshima-like photos of some acid­
rain-devastated forests ought to bring 
home. It is largely the fear of prolific hordes 
from outside Europe overrunning the be­
loved continer:lt which tempts the white 
racial conservatives to opt for overpopula­
tion. 

Romania remains a nice, roomy country. 
Yet Communist dictator Nicolai Ceausescu 
has launched a drive to doublethe birthrate 
in six years, to four children per couple. 
Why? According to Gwynne Dyer, a Lon­
don-based columnist, "the presumption in 
Bucharest is that he is worried about the 
Gypsies." There are "only" a million or so 
among Romania's 22 million people, but 
anyone who has been around Gypsies very 
long knows that a ratio of 1 swindler to 20 
"marks" spells disaster and the ratio is 
getting worse. (50 bad are the Gypsies that 
some years ago the American TV show Ko­
jak actually had an episode which showed 
them for the cheats they generally are. 
Those watching the program felt they had 
reentered the pre-"civil rights" era through 
a time warp.) 

Why should Gypsies be permitted to out­
breed the host population which sustains 
them? Distressingly, even a tough hombre 
like Ceausescu does not feel safe enough 
from "world opinion" to undertake a pro­
gram to sterilize Gypsies. And so, because 
of the whims of a million or so interlopers 
from India, Romania is condemned to a 
breeding war it doesn't really want and that 
its land doesn't need. 

Israel. At a Jewish feminists' conference 
held in Jerusalem last summer, Elizabeth 
Holtzmann, a sort of female Simon Wies­
enthal, drew gasps of surprise from the 
audience when she stated that half of all 
Democratic Party convention delegates are 
women. Another American speaker, Betty 
Friedan, recalled her first trip to Israel, 
"where to my amazement I was regarded 
as a leper and Golda wouldn't see me." 
Israeli feminist Shulamit Aloni said that 
there was a myth about the independence 
of Israeli women because Golda Meir had 
become prime minister. But, said Mrs. 
Aloni, Meir had gained cabinet status only 
because David Ben-Gurion had insisted, "I 
won't preside over a cabinet without a wo­
man." 

Though there are 10 women in the 120­
seat Knesset, feminism here is going no­
where fast. The religious courts, which 
handle all divorce cases and other family 
matters, still do not allow women in judi­
cial positions. Indeed, women are not even 
permitted to appear as witnesses before 
such courts. (The civil courts do allow fe­
male judges and witnesses.) 
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Mrs. Aloni feels that the status of women 
is declining in Israel as the religious parties 
(with significant female backing) gain 
strength. The only feminist group in Haifa 
(Jewish population 210(000) was recently 
discontinued "for lack of interest." 

A study released late last year by the 
Institute for Social Research in Tel Aviv 
compared the "self-image" of Israel i wo­
men to that of American blacks before the 
civil rights revolution. Interviews with 
1,040 Israeli workers -- male and female -­
showed that the latter do not see them­
selves in any way "disadvantaged," despite 
their low status in the labor market. (Their 
more fundamental status as mothers and 
wives was, of course, not addressed.) 
While 40.4% of the men interviewed felt 
they were underpaid, only 31.6% of the 
women felt the same way. (One wonders 
how many of the women felt their hus­
bands were underpaid.) 

The "solution"? Israeli women must be 
"sufficiently socialized" so they will devel­
op among themselves a feeling of I 'fraterna I 
deprivation" (a curious choice of words). 

* * * 
Another new Israel i study suggests that 

while "some 50% of Israeli couples are 
sexually incompatible ... only 1% arewil­
ling to seek help." This, said Dr. Ronald 
Wertikowsky, is because the Israeli male is 
generally "vain and boastful," a "highly 
ambitious type who loves to regard himself 
as a success," while the Israeli female is 
often frigid and "extremely passive in and 
about sex." She would allegedly "rather 
buy new shoes" than see a much-needed 
sex therapist. 

* * * 
Another Israeli with blunt things to say 

about his countrymen is former Knesset 
member Meir Pa'il, now a history professor 
at Tel Aviv University: 

Israel is a parasitic consumer society. 
In the U.S., people work for it. But the 
environment [herel is of a consumer so­
ciety paid for by the u.s. 

* * * 
"Equal Employment Opportunity" is an 

unknown concept in Israel. On October 
14, the Arabic-language daily al Ittihad 
translated three not very unusual advertise­
ments from the Hebrew-language Yedifot 
Aharanot of October 5. All three ads had 
been placed by Israeli employers who 
would not consider non-Jewish applicants. 
One was quite explicit: 

Workers! You are turning our factories 
over to the Arabs. You are becoming beg­
gars who prefer handouts from the gov­
ernment and the Histadrut [Jewish Trade 

Foundationl. Ta'mas Industries offers 
you work and wages. With your support 
we continue production. Call OJ­
801121/3. 

* * * 
Last June, the Israeli Military Govern­

ment in the occupied territories decreed a 
prison sentence of 20 years for the throwing 
of stones at Israeli vehicles. The Jerusalem 
Radio Hebrew Service reported on Octo­
ber 15 that 800 Arab residents had recently 
been convicted of stone-throwing. 

* * * 
The Palestinian fishermen of Gaza have 

been restricted to progressively smaller 
fishing grounds, and now must stay within 
a tiny 10-by-24 kilometer strip of the Med­
iterranean, while their Israeli competitors 
go to the richer grounds further out. In or­
der to survive, the Palestinians sometimes 
risk stiff fines, boat confiscations and being 
fired upon by the Israeli coast guard. 

* * * 
On December 11, the American and Is­

raeli navies began a joint antisubmarine 
warfare exercise in the eastern Mediterran­
ean. It was part of President Reagan's year­
old agreement to increase "military coop­
eration" between the two countries. 

* * * 
The Narkis Street Baptist Church, in Jeru­

salem, has the largest Christian congrega­
tion in Israel. After repeated unsuccessful 
bombings, the 60-year-old sanctuary was 
destroyed by arson in October 1982. Some 
$400,000 has been raised toward its re­
building, but Orthodox Jewish demonstra­
tors are trying to keep it from happening. 

* * * 
The Responsa Project in Tel Aviv is feed­

i ng the Talmud and other Jewish holy 
books into a computer, permitting easy ac­
cess to the whole by selection of a word or 
subject matter. Project director Yaacov 
Choueka says, "Our aim is to eventually 
put all of Jewish culture on computer." 

It was just three years ago that the Knes­
set ruled that Israeli lawyers could cite pre­
cedents from Jewish law in civil (as op­
posed to religious) courts. Previously, only 
secular European legal codes had been 
quarried. So quickly is Israel being "theo­
cratized" by the nation's antidisestablish­
mentarians that the Responsa Project's 
computer terminals are already being con­
sulted regularly for Jewish precedents by 
the nation's "civil" lawyers and even by its 
Su preme Cou rt justices. 

Legal scholars for whom "jewish law" 
once meant European Jewish are now cit­
ing the opinions of ancient Syrian and Ye­
menite rabbis, whose answers to social 
problems are unprejudicially spewed out 
by the computer alongside those of the 
most celebrated Polish rabbis. 



Black Africa. Smith Hempstone, the ed­
itor-in-chief of the Washington Times, 
spent three years in the late 1950s traveling 
from Eritrea in the African northeast to the 
Cape of Good Hope in the south to Senegal 
in the northwest. Today, he says, the 
60,000-mile journey would be impossible. 
"Law and order has collapsed over large 
areas of the continent as fast as the bridges 
that once spanned its rivers." 

Only 8% of the Western aid which has 

flowed into the drought-stricken nations of 
Africa over the past 10 years has reached 
the people directly in need. Most has gone 
toward cosmetic projects like modern air­
ports, or to pampering the elite class, 
which, "with very few exceptions, [has] 
been having a marvelous time." Few Afri­
cans actually died of hunger during the 
colonial era, but many do today, even as a 
nation like Ethiopia spends $2.5 billion 
(46% of its GNP) on Soviet military hard­

Pro-White Video Mill 
The first white racialist leader to exploit 

the video revolution in a major way ap­
pears to be Tom Metzger, the fou nder of the 
White American Political Association 
(WAPA, P.O. Box 65, Fallbrook, CA 
92028). Metzger and at least a dozen of his 
supporters have gone through the video 
workshops provided free to citizens by Cox 
Cable of San Diego as part of its federally 
mandated "public access" requirements. 
In WAPA's own private studio, which is of 
professional quality, the Metzger team be­
gan at once to produce a long series of 
half-hour discussion programs featuring 
the sort of "controversial" figures who do 
not easily obtain a fair hearing. The first six 
programs to emerge from the Metzger vid­
eo mill: 

• The Odinists. Californians who follow 
the old Norse gods explain their world­
view. 

• White Student Union. An interview 
with the national director, Greg Withrow. 

• Truth Missions. Holocaust revision­
ism is discussed by David McCalden. 

• Ku Klux Klan. A California leader of 
the Klan relates its three-part history. 

• "Mountain Churches" of Michigan. 
Rev. Robert Miles tells about his growing 
organ ization. 

• Moslem Fundamentalism. Moham­
med Zaky defends his people's perspec­
tive. 

The Metzger talk show, called "Race and 
Reason," has been running on southern 
California public access cable channels 
since September. The goal at that time was 
to reach 50 cities nationwide by early 
1985, but its attainment depended on doz­
ens of individuals doing their part. 

Those who would like, for once, to see 
people with unpopular views allowed to 
speak freely at length without feeling bul­
lied and backed into a corner, should write 
to WAPA for further information on be­
coming a local distributor. WAPA also pub­
lishes the newspaper White American Re­
sistance and sells older audio and video 
cassette tapes showing Metzger debating 
college professors, confronting the Jewish 
Defense League and otherwise resisting 

what some would call "the inevitable." In 
the future, the energetic Metzger expects to 
produce a new "Race and Reason" pro­
gram each week. 

Another white activist with extensive 
video plans is David Duke of the NMWP 
(Box 10625, New Orleans, LA 70181), 
who will likely be running for President in 
1988, and hopes to get plenty of free publi­
city via cable television. 

Liberty's Last Chance? 
Every Western democracy except ours 

and Holland's provides in some way for a 
federal referendum or initiative, which 
(ideally) allows the people to vote directly 
on issues of pressing concern. Every state 
except Delaware provides for a referendum 
in its constitution, and 23 make allowances 
for initiatives. (The difference is that refer­
enda let the people approve or disapprove 
statutes or amendments entered into law by 
the legislature, while initiatives permit citi­
zens to write their own statutes or amend­
ments.) 

In 1977, a populist group called Initiative 
America was founded in Washington to 
push for a constitutional amendment estab­
lishing a national referendum. It won sup­
port from former United States Senator 
James Abourezk, who is best known for his 
even-handed approach to the Middle East, 
which has deeply offended the Zionist lob­
by. Hearings on the initiative amendment 
were held by the Senate Judiciary Commit­
tee, but nothing came of them. 

Today, certain populist groups are ad­
vocating what they call the Annual Federal 
Referendum, or AFR, which they say would 
combine the best features of both the ref­
erendum and the initiative. Under the plan, 
as many as six hot issues would be decided 
by national popular vote in September of 
each year, and the results would have a 
sobering effect on politicians running in the 
November elections. 

One place to read about the AFR is 
Chuck Aronson's rambling populist news­
letter, Peephole on People, which is pub­
lished monthly at 11520 Bixby Hill Rd., 
Arcade, NY 14009. A 14-page issue called 

ware and $150 million on a celebration of 
the first decade of Marxist dictatorship. 

Hempstone closed by advising the Rev­
erend Walter Fauntroy, Washington D.C's 
nonvoting delegate in Congress, to leave 
the fashionable protestors outside the 
South African Embassy and proceed to the 
Ethiopian Embassy at 2134 Kalorama 
Road. "But there are no votes for you 
there," he warned. 

"Initiatives and Referendums" is full of 
names and addresses for aspiring AFR ac­
tivists to correspond with. Aronson, 71, 
who says he invented the Transverse Front 
Drive automobile in 1931, when he would 
have been 18, sprinkles his writing with 
references to "exploding parasite popula­
tions" and "wimpy politicians" ("Mondale 
would tilt Italy to straighten up the leaning 
tower of Pisa -- that's the kind of wimp he 
is"). It is the newsletter editor's deeply felt 
conviction that direct democracy is about 
the only way left to spare America from its 
historically almost inevitable drift toward 
dictatorship by special interests. 

Books for Aryanists 
The Viking ethos and myth os have and 

should have a consuming interest for In­
staurationists. To appease this interest, one 
of our most intensely Nordic subscribers 
has supplied us with a list of Viking or 
Viking-related books available at new or 
used bookstores. Bantam Books, he in­
forms us, started releasing Eric Nielson's 
Haakon volumes last year. Three titles 
($2.95 each) are in print so far. Since 1979, 
Zebra Books has published several of Sig­
fridur Skaldaspillir's Eric Brighteyes series, 
based on Sir H. Rider Haggard's adventure 
classic of the same name, in paperback. 
These books can be had in used book em­
poria for about half the original $2.25 
price. Also from Zebra is Poul Anderson's 
movingly written trilogy, The Last Viking, 
featuring that greatest of Scandinavian fili­
busters, Harald Hadrada. The 7'1" blond 
giant nearly succeeded in creating an im­
mense 1/Aryan Arc" of power extending 
from Russia (Novgorod) through Sweden 
and Norway to the British Isles (York and 
Dublin). The powerful mentality and amaz­
ing physical vitality which generated this 
tremendous geopolitical feat are almost un­
imaginable to the degenerate, played-out 
descendants of Hadrada who inhabit Scan­
dinavia today. Anderson's other contribu­
tion is Hrolf Kraki's Saga, which Ballantine 
published and later brought out under its 
Del Rey imprint. By far the goriest Viking 
tomes are those of Eric Langholm, whose 
series, The Vikings, was printed by Sphere 
Books in the U.K. and by Pinnacle Books, 
beginning in 1975, here in Vinland. Fin­
ally, persistent bookhounds might uncover 

INSTAURATION -- APRIL 1985 -- PAGE 35 



Edison Marshall's two titles from the 1950s, 
The Viking and West with the Vikings. 

Wh iIe the paperback editions mentioned 
above should be relatively easy to acquire, 
two notable hardcover titles from the early 
part of the century will take some search­
ing: Paul du Chaillu's Ivar the Viking and 
E.R. Edison's Styribiorn the Strong. One last 
suggestion: John Richard Jefferies's The 
Story of My Heart, the epitome of Indo­
European nature mysticism and one of the 
seminal books of early-day Aryanism, is 
available for $3.75 retail from Charles 
River Press, 1 Thompson Square, Boston, 
MA02129. 

You'll Love UHate" 
The annual American Film Festival in 

Zoo City is billed as the most influential 
documentary and short film showcase in 
the U.S. Some presentations are well craft­
ed and entertaining, but the social-issue 
films have been a litter of liberal-minority 
doctored-dramas -- distorted, subjective 
manipulations masquerading as fair and 
equal treatment of controversial themes. 
These make for tedious viewing at best, 
infuriating viewing at worst. However, 
amid this year's ocean of blackness shone 
one glimmer of light: a Canadian docu­
mentary called Hate. 

It is a very un-student-like student film 
that puts to shame the "editorials" of Injun 
Dan, not only because of its technical profi­
ciency, but because of its truly well-bal­
anced presentation of differing points of 
view concerning t,",e race issue. There is no 
on- or off-camera narrator/journalist "safe­
ly" re-interpreting the words of those in­
terviewed. The film editing does not distort, 
but rather clarifies ideas as each inter­
viewee states his opinions in an uninter­
rupted manner -- the Chairperson of the 
Committee for Racial Equality; the Chap­
lain, and National Director of the Canadian 
Knights of the Ku Klux Klan; and a Cana­
dian Black Nationalist. 

Hate's departure point is the conflict in 
Toronto between the Klan and the Commit­
tee for Racial Equality, which stages a 
swarming "Ban the Klan" protest through 
the city's streets. It is a mistake to dismiss 
this Canadian film as inapplicable else­
where. The issue, problems and opinions it 
explores are presented in a way that em­
phasizes their universal relevance. The un­
washed mass of muddies, despoilers, prod­
itors and trucklers that populate the film's 
1/anti-fascist" demonstrations are the same 
refuse that threaten our race's survival 
whether they flock together in Toronto, 
Brixton, Washington, D.C., or Jonestown 
by the Bay. Contrary to what some may 
bel ieve, Canada has not escaped the cu 1­
ture-mulching minority influence, clearly 
revealed in this film. 

PAGE 36 --INSTAURATION -- APRIL 1985 

The title, Hate, can be understood to de­
scribe the methods and views of the "anti­
racists" who hypocritically hurl threats and 
invective at their opposition. Throughout 
the film the "Chairperson" of the Commit­
tee for Racial Equality (who happens to be a 
"professor of sociology") foams with unde­
niable hatred against the Klan to a crowd of 
eager journalists, voicing his rabid intoler­
ance for the freedom of speech and assem­
bly occasionally and partially extended to 
it. On several occasions the Klan leader 
retaliates by accusing the Committee for 
Racial Equality of being a thinly disguised 
Communist front group, and notes commu­
nism's enormously more violent historical 
record -- yet, he adds, the Klan does not 
seek to suppress their freedom of speech. 
The Klan leader is calm, rational, clean-cut 
and well-spoken. He contrasts sharply with 
the IIChairperson" primate whose repul­
sive appearance and abrasive demeanor 
scream out his racial affiliation like a neon 
yarmulke. 

Some of the Black Nationalist's state­
ments are surprisingly honest, unique in a 
film, and support Instauratiods views in 
key points. For example, the Black Nation­
alist denounces the deceptive anti-racism 
of the Committee for Racial Equality be­
cause "they are just as racist as the Klan." 
He asserts quite clearly that whites have a 
right to be racists, and that he happens to be 
a black racist who opposes integration and 
defends racial purity, as he believes many 
blacks do. All in all, his remarks add up to a 
great unmasking of the racial equality 
movement. 

Hate's most interesting sequence is atthe 
end: in an interview, the "Chairperson" 
explodes into a verbally abusive fit of self­
righteous victimization, then openly admits 
that he is a Communist of the shockingest 
pink, presumably unaware that he is still 
being filmed. This exceptional disclosure 
definitely strikes a powerfully disturbing 
blow to the slumber of the uninitiated, and 
is probably the most satisfying piece of film 
since the Klan galloped to the rescue in 
Griffith's Birth ofa Nation. 

Hate is the film that Instaurationists (es­
pecially high-school teachers, university 
and college professors and other educators) 
should enthusiastically welcome as the op­
portunity to present a truly balanced per­
spective on the race issue. With some intel­
ligent guidance, it can lead young and not 
so young truth-starved Majority members 
on the path to racial reality. Winner of the 
award for the best Canadian documentary 
and a participant in the Cannes Film Festi­
val, Hate (16mm, B & W, 25 min.) has won 
the praise of some of North America's most 
talented cinematographers. An education- ­
ai, political or historical institution could 
hardly spend its audio-visual dollars more 
importantly. Interested parties should con­

tact Omega Films Limited, 70 Milner Ave­
nue, Unit 5A, Scarborough, Ontario, Can­
ada M1S 3P8. Phone: (416) 291-4733. 

A ZPG Man Wises Up 
If America seems to have a great food 

surplus today, it's partly because so many 
of its citizens bred responsibly in the past. 
Yet appearances are deceiving, and much 
of our best soil is now being lost as we try to 
feed the irresponsible Third World hordes. 
Until that situation changes, "we should 
not give away our resources -- not so much 
as one bushel of wheat." So argued John­
son C. Montgomery, a founding member of 
Zero Population Growth, in Newsweek's 
"My Turn" column for December 23. 

Now don't ask me to cut my children 
back to the same number of calories that 
children from large families eat. In fact, 
don't ask me to cut my children back on 
anything. I won't do it without a fight 
.... Nancy and I made a conscious deci­
sion to limit the number of our children 
[to twol so each child could have a larger 
share of whatever we could make avail­
able. We intend to keep the best for them. 

After all, "someone must protectthe mater­
ial and intellectual seed grain for the fu­
ture." A high quality of life at home is the 
greatest contribution America can make to 
the world. 

Music for Us 
Attention all musically inclined readers! 

If you have (or know anyone who has) 
composed or performed tunes dealing with 
social/racial issues from the Instauration 
perspective, please send them to: Majority 
Music & Entertainment Association, P.O. 
Box 16007, Alexandria, VA 22302. Eric 
Matthews, a young, up-and-coming music 
and video arts critic, seeks to collect a di­
verse mixture of pro-Majority music. Of 
particular interest are rec~nt underground 
efforts in a new wave, punk, pop or country 
vein. If enough original tunes are worth 
listening to, his tape-editing/duplication 
equipment could be used to assemble a 
compilation tape to send out to all interest­
ed takers. Future projects may include de­
veloping a network of contacts to spur pro­
Majority musicality. 

Unponderable Quote 

In their comparative study [of test re­
sults], the North Carolina researchers used 
a narrow definition of "whites," which ex­
cluded Orientals, Hispanics and American 
Indians. 

T.R. Reid, 
Washington Post 


